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Article 3.20 

STORMWATER 

Sections: 

3.20.011 Purpose. 
3.20.015 Definitions. 
3.20.025 Findings. 
3.20.035 Policy. 
3.20.045 City Responsibilities. 
3.20.055 Private Responsibilities. 
 
3.20.011 Purpose. 
 
The purpose of GRC Articles 3.20 to 3.60 is to 
provide for the effective management of 
stormwater and drainage, and to maintain and 
improve water quality in the public stormwater 
system and to protect beneficial uses of 
groundwater and waters of the state or the United 
States. 
(Ord. No. 1790, Amended, 01/01/2019; Ord. No. 1700, 
Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1579, Enacted, 01/01/2004) 
 
3.20.015 Definitions. 
 
In addition to the definitions set forth in GRC 
1.05.010, unless the context requires otherwise, 
for purposes of GRC Articles 3.20 through 3.60, 
the following mean: 
 

Approved Drainage System.  A system approved 
by the manager that adequately infiltrates, 
collects, conveys, treats and/or disposes of 
stormwater runoff. Approved drainage systems 
shall meet all requirements and specifications of 
GRC Articles 3.20 to 3.60 and any design 
documents adopted by the city. 
 
Best Management Practices (BMPs).  Procedures, 
practices, prohibition of practices, activities, 
educational activities used to prevent or reduce the 
discharge of pollutants directly or indirectly to 
groundwater or waters of the state or the United 
States.  BMPs include but are not limited to 
treatment requirements, operating and 
maintenance procedures, practices to control site 
runoff, spillage or leaks, waste disposal, and 
drainage of materials from storage; and the 
prohibition of specific activities, practices, and 

procedures. 
Building Footprint.  The area enclosed by the 
perimeter walls of the house and other covered 
structures (e.g., garage, carport, patio) for 
residential, or the perimeter walls of all structures 
for non-residential. 
 
Clean Water Act (CWA).  Federal Water Pollution 
Control Act enacted by Public Law 92-500 as 
amended by Public Laws 95-217, 95-576, 96-483, 
and 97-117 (33 USC § 1251 et seq.). 
 
Customer/User.  The owner, renter, or lessee of 
property served directly or indirectly by the public 
stormwater system. 
 
Development.  Physical improvement to real 
property, including the construction of structures 
or the placement of pavement or other impervious 
surfaces that result in an increase in the area of 
impervious surface on the property. 
 
Discharge.  Any direct or indirect release into or 
that ultimately reaches the public stormwater 
system, surface water or groundwater. 
 
Drainage Residential Unit (DRU).  One drainage 
residential unit is the impervious surface area 
which is estimated to place approximately equal 
demand on the public stormwater system as that 
placed by an average single detached  dwelling 
unit.  One DRU equals 2,500 square feet of 
impervious surface. 
 
Groundwater.  Water located below the ground 
surface or surface water which has infiltrated into 
the ground. 
 
Hazardous Materials.  Any material, including any 
substance, waste, or combination thereof, which 
because of its quantity, concentration, or physical, 
chemical, or infectious characteristics may cause, 
or significantly contribute to, a substantial present 
or potential hazard to:  a) public health and safety, 
b) pets and wildlife, or c) the environment, when 
improperly treated, stored, transported, disposed 
of, or otherwise managed.   
 
Illicit Connection.  An illicit connection is defined 
as either of the following: 



GRESHAM REVISED CODE 

 (3) 3  

(1)  Any physical connection to the public 
stormwater system, which has not been approved 
by the public entity responsible for the operation 
and maintenance of the system. 

 
(2) Any drain or conveyance, whether on the 

surface or subsurface, which allows an illicit 
discharge to enter the public stormwater system 
including but not limited to any conveyances 
which allow sewage, process wastewater, wash 
water, or non-stormwater pollutants to enter the 
public stormwater system and any connections to 
the public stormwater system from indoor drains 
and sinks with potential to introduce pollutants to 
the public stormwater system. 
 
Illicit Discharge.  Any discharge to the public 
stormwater system that is not entirely stormwater, 
not covered under a Municipal or Industrial 
NPDES permit, or not exempted in this chapter.  
 
Impervious Area.  The calculated or measured 
area of impervious surfaces on a site, including 
sidewalks located in the public right-of-way 
adjacent to the site. 
 
Impervious Surface.  Any structures or surface 
improvements that prevent or retard infiltration of 
water into the surface of the soil.  Common 
impervious surfaces include, but are not limited to 
rooftops, sidewalks, streets, walkways, patio 
areas, driveways, parking lots or storage areas, or 
other surfaces that similarly impede the natural 
infiltration or increase runoff patterns. 
 
Improved Property.  Any property, public or 
private, which the manager determines has been 
altered such that the net stormwater runoff from 
the site is greater than that which could be 
expected without the alteration.  Improved 
property shall not include highways and roads 
within the State of Oregon or City of Gresham 
rights-of-way. 
 
Industrial Discharger.  Discharger of stormwater 
associated with industrial activity as defined by 40 
CFR 122.26. 
 
Industrial NPDES Stormwater Discharge Permits.  
General, group, or individual permits issued by 
Oregon DEQ regulating facilities defined in 40 

CFR 122.26 which engage in industrial activity 
pursuant to the Clean Water Act. 
 
Major Storm Event.  A rain or snow storm, or 
combined rainfall and snow melt event which 
produces stormwater runoff equivalent to that 
produced by a 10-year or larger rainfall event. 
 
Municipal Separate Storm Sewer System (MS4).  
MS4 means a conveyance or system of 
conveyances (including roads with drainage 
systems, municipal streets, catch basins, curbs, 
gutters, ditches, manmade channels, or storm 
drains) that is: 1) owned or operated by a state, 
city, town, borough, county, parish, district, 
association, or other public body having 
jurisdiction over disposal of sewage, industrial 
wastes, stormwater, or other wastes, including 
special districts under state law such as a 
wastewater district, flood control district or 
drainage district, or similar entity, or an Indian 
tribe or an authorized Indian tribal organization, or 
a designated and approved management agency 
under Section 208 of the CWA that discharges to 
waters of the state or the United States; 2) 
designed or used for collecting or conveying 
stormwater; 3) which is not a combined 
wastewater; or 4) which is not a part of a publicly 
owned treatment works as defined at 40 CFR 
122.2. 
 
Municipal NPDES Stormwater Discharge 
Permits.  Permits issued by EPA or its state 
delegate as defined by CWA Section 402 (b) and 
40 CFR Part 123regulating stormwater discharge 
to the waters of the state or the United States from 
MS4. 
 
Net Stormwater Runoff.  The increment of 
stormwater runoff from a property that is 
attributable to development on that property. 
 
Non-Stormwater Discharge.  Any discharge to the 
public stormwater system that is not entirely 
stormwater. 
 
On-Site Stormwater Management.  The 
management of stormwater as close to the 
impervious source as possible.  For public streets, 
on-site stormwater management is defined as 
management within the public right-of-way.  For 
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non-residential buildings, on-site stormwater 
management is defined as management within the 
individual tax lot.  For residential  development, 
on-site stormwater management is defined as 
management within the collective boundary of the 
individual tax lots. 
 
Open Drainageway.  A natural or human-made 
path, swale, ditch, or channel which has the 
specific function of conveying natural stream 
water or stormwater runoff. 
 
Pollutant.  Anything which causes or contributes 
to pollution. 
 
Pollution.  The degradation of the physical, 
thermal, chemical, biological or radioactive 
properties of the public stormwater system or the 
waters of the state or the United States.  Pollution 
also means the discharge of any pollutant into the 
public stormwater system or the waters of the state 
or the United States, which will or is likely to 
create a nuisance or to render such waters harmful, 
detrimental or injurious to:  a) public health and 
safety, b) the environment, or c) both; or to 
domestic, commercial, industrial, recreational, 
aesthetic, or other beneficial uses. 
 
Premises.  Any building, lot, parcel of land, or 
portion of land whether improved or unimproved 
including adjacent sidewalks and parking strips. 
 
Public Stormwater System.  All public facilities or 
improvements that infiltrate, collect, convey or 
control the flow of stormwater or that improve or 
control the water quality of stormwater.  The 
public stormwater system includes the municipal 
separate storm system; the waters of the state; the 
waters of the United States; all creeks; natural 
drainageways; inlets; culverts; dams; levees; 
desilting, detention, retention, and recharging 
basins or structures; stormwater management 
facilities located on public property or within 
dedicated easements on private property; 
groundwater; outfall structures; underground 
injection controls; wetlands; and equipment and 
appurtenances necessary to operate any of the 
above. 
 
Stormwater.  Surface runoff and drainage 
associated with rainstorm events and snow melt. 

Stormwater Connection.  A connection of 
stormwater from private property to the public 
stormwater system, including weep holes through 
a curb. 
 
Stormwater Connection Charges. All charges 
required for the right to connect to the public 
stormwater system, including stormwater 
connection fee and system development charges. 
 
Stormwater Customer.  The person responsible for 
the improved property receiving stormwater 
services.  The State of Oregon shall not be 
considered stormwater customers for any highway 
or road improvements within its rights-of-way.  
The State shall be stormwater customers for all 
other property they own within Gresham. 
 
Stormwater Management Facilities.  Facilities that 
the manager has determined reduce net 
stormwater runoff from an improved property 
and/or reduce pollution into the surface water and 
groundwater.  These facilities shall include 
stormwater detention, retention, and water quality 
treatment systems to mitigate additional runoff 
and associated pollutants produced from increased 
impervious areas, including public facilities that 
were constructed without public resources. 
 
Stormwater Service.  The operation of the city's 
stormwater utility in providing programs and 
facilities for maintaining, improving, regulating, 
collecting, and managing stormwater quantity and 
quality within the city's service area, including 
compliance with Urban Flood Safety and Water 
Quality District requirements.  This includes 
meeting regulatory requirements for protecting, 
monitoring, and reporting on water quality and on 
species listed under the Endangered Species Act. 
 
Stormwater User Charge.  A reoccurring charge 
paid by the stormwater customer for the use of the 
public stormwater system or for the provision of 
stormwater service by the city. 
 
Surface Water.  Water which travels over the 
ground surface to the public stormwater system, a 
private stormwater facility, or to any waters of the 
state or United States. 
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Total Maximum Daily Load (TMDL).  A 
calculation of the allowable pollutant loading that 
a body of water can receive from all contributing 
point and non-point sources.  The calculation 
includes a measure of safety to ensure that the 
body of water complies with Section 303 of the 
Clean Water Act which is established by the DEQ 
or EPA. 
 
Toxic Chemicals.  A toxic chemical is any 
chemical or waste that when ingested or absorbed 
is harmful or fatal to living organisms as 
recognized by any state or federal agency.  
 
Underground Injection Control (UIC).  A drywell, 
soakage trench, infiltration vault or chamber, 
improved sinkhole, sewage drain hole, subsurface 
fluid distribution system or other system of 
groundwater point source used for the subsurface 
emplacement or discharge of fluids. 
 
Water Pollution Control Facility (WPCF) Permit. 
A permit issued by Oregon DEQ to regulate 
discharges to groundwater. 
 
Waters of the United States.  Surface watercourses 
and water bodies as defined in 20 CFR Section 
122.2. 
 (Ord. No. 1851, Amended, 10/17/2024; Ord. No. 1832, 
Amended, 09/15/2022; Ord. No. 1822, Amended, 
11/08/2021; Ord. No. 1709, Amended, 01/01/2019; Ord. No. 
1773, Amended, 07/01/2017; Ord. No. 1750, Amended, 
05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 
1647, Amended, 09/20/2007; Ord. No. 1602, Amended, 
04/01/2005; Ord. No. 1579, Amended, 1/1/2004; Ord. No. 
1507, Amended, 10/19/2000; Ord. No. 1412, Amended, 
01/16/1997; Ord. No. 1400, Amended, 10/03/1996; Ord. No. 
1379, Amended, 12/07/1995; Ord. No. 1359, Amended, 
05/18/1995; Ord. No. 1334, Amended, 11/03/1994; Ord. No. 
1317, Amended, 07/01/1994; Ord. No. 1293, Enacted, 
07/01/1994) 
 
3.20.025 Findings. 
 
Effects of Stormwater Runoff 
 

(1) All real property within Gresham drains 
into either surface waters or the groundwater. The 
flow volumes of surface water and the amount of 
nonpoint source pollution are directly related to 
development of property and the creation of 
impervious surface. 

 

(2) The city's growth and development has 
and will continue to increase the volume of 
stormwater runoff and the amount of stormwater 
pollution into the public stormwater system, 
except where sufficient on-site stormwater 
management, green infrastructure, and/or low 
impact development practices are used. 

 
(3) Stormwater runoff may cause property 

damage and erosion. It can carry concentrations of 
nutrients, sediments, heavy metals, oils and toxic 
materials, and other pollutants into receiving 
waters and ground water. 

 
(4) Poorly maintained conveyance systems 

contribute to flooding hazards and property 
damage.  Stormwater discharged into public 
rights-of-way, if not properly managed, will cause 
damage to the public rights-of-ways and will 
create hazards for the travelling public.  Therefore, 
the proper disposal of stormwater is an obligation 
of the occupants of the property or those who 
engage in activity upon real property that directly 
or indirectly discharges stormwater into the public 
stormwater system, groundwater, or waters of the 
state or the United States. 
 
Benefits of Public Stormwater System 
 

(5) Stormwater runoff must be managed in a 
manner that protects public health and safety, pets, 
wildlife, and the environment. 

 
(6) The city provides a valuable public 

service by improving the quality of stormwater 
discharges and maintaining a public stormwater 
system that collects and disposes stormwater 
discharged from impervious surfaces and public 
rights-of-way within the city. The services 
provided are necessary to ensure compliance with 
state and federal laws pertaining to stormwater 
discharges.  Effective management of stormwater 
infiltration and flow helps to keep public rights-
of-way free of flooding, thereby improving 
personal and emergency access for all users of the 
city's transportation system and helps to protect 
property, groundwater, and waters of the state and 
United States. 
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Private Responsibilities 
 

(7) Every person that uses property has an 
obligation to minimize or eliminate detrimental 
impacts on other persons or property that result 
from such use.  If a user of property alters the 
property in any way that increases the flow or 
pollutant load of water from the property, the user 
must provide on-site mitigation facilities to 
control the flow and quality of stormwater runoff 
and must maintain such facilities in accordance 
with GRC Articles 3.20 to 3.60. 
 
Existing Public Stormwater System Not Adequate 
 

(8) The existing public stormwater system 
cannot adequately address stormwater runoff 
quantity and quality issues.  There is a need for 
additional funding to provide for adequate 
construction, operation, and maintenance of the 
public stormwater system. 
 
Stormwater Utility 
 

(9) As a condition of issuance of an NPDES 
permit the Environmental Protection Agency 
(EPA) requires public agencies to identify a 
permanent source of funding for the stormwater 
program to ensure compliance with the permit.  
EPA's recommended method of funding, 
nationally, is the stormwater utility concept and 
the use of user charges for stormwater service. 

 
(10) The public stormwater system 

constitutes a public utility owned and operated by 
the city.  The utility exists to provide a municipal 
service that is essential to:  a) public health and 
safety, b) the environment, or c) both. 

 
(11) Users of property who use stormwater 

services are charged rates that recover the cost of 
construction, operation, and maintenance of the 
public stormwater system.  Users of property who 
undertake the installation of facilities on their 
property that reduce pollution and eliminate the 
discharge of runoff into the public stormwater 
system should be given a credit, in proportion to 
the degree of reduction, against stormwater user 
charges that would otherwise be due. 
(Ord. No. 1822, Amended, 11/08/2021; Ord. No. 1790 
Amended, 01/01/2019; Ord. No. 1750, Amended, 

05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1647, Amended, 09/20/2007; Ord. No. 
1602, Amended, 04/01/2005; Ord. No. 1579, Amended, 
1/1/2004; Ord. No. 1507, Amended, 10/19/2000; Ord. No. 
1412, Amended, 01/16/1997; Ord. No. 1293, Enacted, 
07/01/1994) 
 
3.20.035 Policy. 
 

(1) The council declares its intention to 
acquire, own, construct, reconstruct, equip, 
operate, regulate, and maintain within the city 
limits, and outside the city limits when consistent 
with the council's adopted policies or 
intergovernmental agreements, a public 
stormwater system, and to require persons 
responsible to construct, reconstruct, maintain, 
and extend the public stormwater system. 

 
(2)  The construction of both the public 

stormwater system and private stormwater 
treatment facilities through or adjacent to a new 
development shall be provided by the person 
responsible for the development.  Improvements 
shall comply with all applicable city ordinances, 
policies, and standards, including but not limited 
to the Public Works Standards, the Oregon 
Plumbing Specialty Code, and the Stormwater 
Management Manual that establishes standards 
and guidelines implementing Best Management 
Practices designed to meet the objectives and 
requirements of GRC Articles 3.20 to 3.60.  
Except as permitted by the manager as provided 
by the Stormwater Management Manual, required 
on-site stormwater management facilities for 
stormwater detention, retention, and water quality 
treatment shall be located on private properties 
and shall be owned and maintained by the 
benefited property. 

 
(3) No portion of this chapter, subsequent 

interpretations of this chapter, or policies adopted 
to implement this chapter shall relieve any 
property owner of assessments levied against real 
property for a local improvement project or for 
abating conditions on the property that violate any 
provision of this code. 

 
(4)  Stormwater shall be managed as close as 

is practicable to development, and shall mimic the 
natural hydrologic cycle by prioritizing infiltration 
techniques as set forth by the Stormwater 
Management Manual. Stormwater management 
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shall avoid a negative impact on adjoining 
properties, nearby streams, wetlands, 
groundwater, and other water bodies.  All local, 
state, and federal permit requirements related to 
implementation of stormwater management 
facilities must be met prior to facility use. Surface 
water discharge from on-site stormwater 
management facilities shall be conveyed via an 
approved drainage system. 
(Ord. No. 1790, Amended, 01/01/2019; Ord. No. 1579, 
Amended, 01/01/2004; Ord. No. 1293, Enacted, 07/01/1994) 
 
3.20.045 City Responsibilities. 
 
The city shall manage the public facilities and 
improvements that are part of the public 
stormwater system.  These facilities and 
improvements include but are not limited to: 
 

(1) Open drainageways on public property or 
within a public drainage easement. 

 
(2) Piped drainage systems and their related 

appurtenances which have been designed and 
constructed expressly for use by the general public 
and accepted by the city, including all drainage 
sumps located in the public rights-of-way or 
designed and located to serve the streets and 
public facilities. 

 
(3) Roadside drainage ditches along 

unimproved city streets, but not access drive 
culverts. 

 
(4) Flood control and water quality treatment 

facilities such as levees, dikes, overflow channels, 
detention systems, retention systems, dams, pump 
stations, groundwater recharging basins, water 
quality facilities such as ponds, swales, and filters, 
that have been designed and constructed expressly 
for use by the general public and accepted by the 
city. 
(Ord. No. 1790, Amended, 01/01/2019; Ord. No. 1507, 
Amended, 10/19/2000; Ord. No. 1293, Amended, 
07/01/1994) 
 
3.20.055 Private Responsibilities. 
 

(1) Stormwater facilities to be managed by the 
persons responsible for property include but are 
not limited to: 

(a) Stormwater facilities which are not 
part of the public stormwater system, 
including portions of private stormwater 
facilities in public easements, located on 
private property and designed to serve the 
property. 

 
(b) Private parking lot storm drains. 
 
(c) Roofs, footings, or area drains. 
 
(d) All Underground Injection Control 

facilities (UICs) and associated water quality 
appurtenances located on private property and 
designed to serve the specific property. 

 
(e) Non-public open drainageways and 

culverts. 
 
(f) Access drive culverts and roof drains 

in the public right-of-way. 
 
(g) On-site private stormwater 

management facilities constructed as a 
condition of development without public 
resources including any detention, retention, 
and water quality treatment systems. 

 
(2) Persons responsible for property shall 

keep non-public open drainageways which they 
possess or control cleared of debris and vegetation 
which impede the drainage function.  If removal 
of vegetation would result in open soils that may 
erode, adequate vegetation to prevent erosion shall 
be maintained.  Large woody debris that has fallen 
naturally or was anchored for habitat pursuant to a 
permit shall not be removed from a stream, natural 
pond, natural or constructed wetland.  If naturally 
fallen large woody debris is deemed to pose public 
safety concerns, the responsible persons shall seek 
approval from the manager prior to removal. 

 
(3) Persons responsible for property shall 

maintain non-public stormwater facilities on any 
property which they possess or control so as: 

 
(a) to prevent flooding or damage to 

other property, 
 
(b) to prevent injury to any person or 

property, 
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(c) to prevent erosion of the watercourse, 
sedimentation, pollution or contamination of 
surface water or groundwater, and  

 
(d) to continue to provide the stormwater 

detention, retention, and water quality 
treatment that was required at the time of 
project approval. 

 
(4) The failure of persons responsible for 

property to comply with the obligations stated in 
GRC 3.20.055(1), (2), or (3) is a violation of this 
chapter. 

 
(5) The conditions on private property which 

may result in situations proscribed by GRC 
3.20.055(2) or (3) are declared to be a danger to:  
a) public health and safety, b) the environment, or 
c) both, and therefore are a nuisance to be abated 
as provide in GRC Chapter 7. 
(Ord. No. 1822, Amended, 11/08/2021; Ord. No. 1790, 
Amended, 01/01/2019; Ord. No. 1750, Amended, 
05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1602, Amended, 04/01/2005; Ord. No. 
1579, Amended, 01/01/2004; Ord. No. 1507, Amended, 
10/19/2000; Ord. No. 1412, Amended, 01/16/1997; Ord. No. 
1293, Amended, 07/01/1994) 
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Article 3.22 

STORMWATER REGULATIONS 

Sections: 

3.22.010 Findings. 
3.22.020 Stormwater Manuals. 
 
 
3.22.010 Findings. 
 

(1) The purpose of GRC Articles 3.22 
through 3.28 is to authorize rules and regulations 
for the development and maintenance of the public 
and private storm and surface water system, to 
provide a comprehensive enforcement program, 
and to provide a process for appeals, in order to 
protect surface water and groundwater. 

 
(2) The Federal Clean Water Act (CWA), as 

implemented by the Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA) National Pollutant Discharge 
Elimination System (NPDES) regulations make 
necessary plans and programs for stormwater 
management meeting specified criteria. 

 
(3) The CWA requires that all large and 

medium sized municipalities must: 
 

(a) prohibit non-stormwater discharge 
into the public stormwater system; and 

 
(b) require controls to reduce the 

discharge of pollutants from stormwater to the 
maximum extent practicable. 

 
(4) Johnson Creek, Fairview Creek, Kelly 

Creek, Burlingame Creek, the Columbia Slough 
and their natural tributaries are considered waters 
of the United States pursuant to the CWA. 

 
(5) The CWA requires states and the 

Environmental Protection Agency (EPA) to 
identify certain sub-standard waters and to set 
"total maximum daily loads" (TMDL's).  The 
Oregon Department of Environmental Quality has 
and will continue to establish TMDL's for water 
bodies within the City of Gresham.  The City of 
Gresham seeks to comply with all TMDL 
requirements. 

(6) The City of Gresham seeks to comply 
with the Endangered Species Act (ESA) and 
associated Section 4(d) Protective Regulations. 

 
(7) The City of Gresham seeks to comply 

with all provisions of the federal law by 
implementing a stormwater management plan, in 
conjunction with other co-permittees. 

 
(8) The City of Gresham seeks to comply 

with all provisions of the Safe Drinking Water Act 
and Divisions 40 and 44 of Chapter 340 of the 
Oregon Administrative Rules pertaining to 
Underground Injection Control facilities. 
(Ord. No. 1790, Amended, 01/01/2019; Ord. No. 1750, 
Amended, 05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1579, Amended, 01/01/2004; 
Ord. No. 1507, Amended, 10/19/2000; Ord. No. 1400, 
Amended, 10/03/1996) 
 
3.22.020 Stormwater Manuals. 
 

(1) Council, by resolution, may adopt and 
amend, as needed, the following manuals as 
necessary to comply with the requirements of the 
federal Clean Water Act, Safe Drinking Water 
Act, state law, and to protect:  a) public health and 
safety, b) the environment, or c) both; and welfare. 

 
(a) Erosion Prevention and Sediment 

Control Manual to establish standards and 
guidelines implementing Best Management 
Practices to provide erosion prevention and 
sediment control from construction sites. 

 
(b) Stormwater Management Manual to 

establish standards and guidelines 
implementing Best Management Practices to 
reduce pollutants from development. 

 
(2) The manager may make minor 

modifications to the manuals.  Council shall 
approve any modifications that have a significant 
policy impact. 
(Ord. No. 1790, Amended, 01/01/2019; Ord. No. 1750, 
Amended, 05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1700, Enacted, 03/03/2011) 
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Article 3.23 

DISCHARGE REGULATIONS 

Sections: 

3.23.010 Discharge of Pollutants. 
3.23.015 Discharge in Violation of Permit. 
3.23.020 Illicit Connections and Illicit 

Discharges. 
3.23.025 Waste Disposal Prohibitions. 
3.23.030 General Discharge Prohibitions. 
 
3.23.010 Discharge of Pollutants. 
 
The commencement, conduct, or continuance of 
any non-stormwater discharge to the public 
stormwater system is prohibited and is a violation 
of this article, except as described below. 
 

(1) The prohibition shall not apply to any 
non-stormwater discharge permitted or approved 
under an Industrial or Municipal NPDES permit, 
waiver, or discharge order issued to the discharger 
and administered by the DEQ, provided that the 
discharger is in full compliance with all 
requirements of the permit, waiver, or discharge 
order and other applicable laws or regulations and 
provided that written approval has been granted by 
the city for any discharge to the municipal separate 
storm wastewater system (MS4). 

 
(2) 
 

(a) Except as provided in subsection (3), 
the prohibition shall not apply to the following 
non-stormwater discharges to the public 
stormwater system, as long best management 
practices are utilized to control or remove 
pollutants, as applicable: water line/reservoir 
flushing, fire hydrant flushing,  dye testing in 
accordance with manufacturers 
recommendations, landscape irrigation, 
diverted stream flows, rising groundwater, 
uncontaminated groundwater infiltration (as 
defined in 40 CFR 35.2005(20)) to the 
municipal separate storm sewer system 
(MS4), uncontaminated pumped 
groundwater, discharges from potable water 
sources, foundation drains, air conditioning 
condensation, irrigation water, springs, water 

from crawl space pumps, footing drains, lawn 
watering, individual residential car washing, 
flows from riparian habitats and wetlands, 
street and pavement wash water,  flows from 
fire-fighting, and treated water from 
investigation, removal, and remedial actions 
selected or approved by DEQ pursuant to 
Oregon Revised Statute (ORS) Chapter 465.  

 
(b) “Street wash water” is defined for 

purposes of this section to be water that 
originates from publicly-financed street 
cleaning activities consistent with the city’s 
NPDES municipal stormwater permit where 
BMPs are applied to protect water. 

 
(c) Discharge of flows to the public or 

private stormwater system from private 
washing of sidewalks, streets and parking lots 
are discouraged to the maximum extent 
practicable. 

 
(3) The manager may require best 

management practices to reduce pollutants, or 
may prohibit a specific discharger from engaging 
in a specific activity identified in subsection (2) if 
at any time the manager determines that the 
discharge is, was, or will be a significant source of 
pollution. 
 (Ord. No. 1790, Amended, 01/01/2019; Ord. No. 1750, 
Amended, 05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 
03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1602, Amended, 04/01/2005; Ord. No. 
1579, Amended, 1/1/2004; Ord. No. 1400, Enacted, 
10/03/1996) 
 
3.23.015 Discharge in Violation of Permit. 
 
Any discharge that would result in or contribute to 
a violation of an existing or future Municipal 
NPDES Permit and any amendments, revisions, or 
reissuance thereof, either separately considered or 
when combined with other discharges, is a 
violation of this chapter and is prohibited.  
Liability for any such discharge shall be the 
responsibility of the persons causing or 
responsible for the discharge, and such persons 
shall defend, indemnify, and hold harmless the 
city in any administrative or judicial enforcement 
action against the permit holder relating to such 
discharge. 
 (Ord. No. 1400, Enacted, 10/03/1996) 
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3.23.020 Illicit Connections and Illicit 
Discharges. 

 
It is prohibited to establish, use, maintain, or 
continue illicit connections to the public 
stormwater system, or to commence or continue 
any illicit discharges to the public stormwater 
system. 
 (Ord. No. 1400, Enacted, 10/03/1996) 
 
3.23.025 Waste Disposal Prohibitions. 
 

(1) No person or business shall throw, 
deposit, leave, maintain, keep, or permit to be 
thrown, deposited, left, or maintained, in or upon 
any public or private property, driveway, parking 
area, street, alley, sidewalk, catch basin, inlet, or 
other component of the public stormwater system, 
materials that may cause or contribute to pollution 
or polluted runoff, including but not limited to:  
waste/wash waters, process by-products or waste, 
hazardous or toxic materials leaks, drips and 
spills, refuse, rubbish, garbage, litter, recycling 
materials, yard debris, landscape materials, 
compost, topsoil, bark, gravel, sand, dirt, sod, 
sediment or sediment-laden runoff from 
construction or landscaping activities, hazardous 
or toxic materials, or other discarded or abandoned 
objects, articles, and accumulations. 

 
(2) Runoff from non-residential related to 

washing of equipment, vehicles, retail products, or 
waste & recycling storage areas or containers shall 
not discharge directly to a private or public 
stormwater system or waters of the state or United 
States.  Runoff from these activities shall be 
collected and/or diverted into the sanitary 
wastewater collection system, unless adequate 
BMPs can be used for the manager to approve an 
alternate discharge location.   
 (Ord. No. 1832, Amended, 09/15/2022; Ord. No. 1790, 
Amended, 01/01/2019; Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 
03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1561, Amended, 01/02/2003; Ord. No. 
1507, Amended, 10/19/2000; Ord. No. 1400, Amended, 
10/03/1996) 
 
3.23.030 General Discharge Prohibitions. 
 
No person or person in charge of property shall 
discharge or cause to be discharged into a private 
or public stormwater system any non-stormwater 

discharge not expressly allowed under GRC 
3.23.010, including, but not limited to: 
 

(1) Any discharge having a visible sheen, or 
containing floating solids or discoloration (except 
dye testing as permitted in GRC 3.23.010(2)(a)); 

 
(2) Any discharge having a pH of less than 

6.5 or greater than 8.5; 
 
(3) Any discharge which causes or may cause 

damage, interference, nuisance or hazard to the 
public stormwater system or the city personnel; or 

 
(4) Any discharge containing human sanitary 

waste or animal feces. 
 (Ord. No. 1790, Amended, 01/01/2019; Ord. No. 1700, 
Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1602, Amended, 
04/01/2005; Ord. No. 1579, Enacted, 01/01/2004) 
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Article 3.24 

REGULATIONS AND REQUIREMENTS 

Sections: 

3.24.010 Compliance with Industrial 
NPDES Stormwater and 
WPCF Permits. 

3.24.015 Compliance with State, Local, and 
Federal Regulations. 

3.24.020 Conflicts with Existing and Future 
Regulatory Requirements of 
Other Agencies. 

3.24.021 Accidental Spill Prevention and 
Control. 

3.24.025 Notification of Spills. 
3.24.030 Requirement to Eliminate Illicit 

Connections. 
3.24.035 Requirement to Remediate. 
3.24.040 Requirement to Monitor and 

Analyze. 
3.24.045 Stormwater Treatment. 
3.24.050 Design and Performance Criteria 

for Stormwater Detention and 
Water Quality Treatment 
Facilities. 

 
3.24.010 Compliance with Industrial 

NPDES Stormwater and 
WPCF Permits. 

 
Any industrial discharger, discharger associated 
with construction activity, or other discharger 
subject to any NPDES or WPCF permit issued by 
the Oregon DEQ, from which pollutants may enter 
the public or private stormwater system, shall 
obtain and comply with all provisions of such 
permits, including notification to and cooperation 
with local entities as required by state and federal 
regulations.  Proof of compliance with said 
permits may be required in a form acceptable to 
the manager prior to issuance of any grading, 
building, occupancy permits or business license.  
At the manager’s request, the discharger shall 
submit a copy of Discharge Monitoring Reports 
required by NPDES or WPCF permits to the city. 
(Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1579, 
Amended, 1/1/2004; Ord. No. 1400, Enacted, 10/03/1996) 
 
 

3.24.015 Compliance with State, Local, and 
Federal Regulations. 

 
All users of the public stormwater system and any 
person or entity whose actions may affect the 
system shall comply with all applicable federal, 
state, and local laws.  Compliance with the 
requirements of this chapter shall in no way 
substitute for or eliminate the necessity for 
compliance with applicable federal, state, and 
local laws. 
 (Ord. No. 1400, Enacted, 10/03/1996) 
 
3.24.020 Conflicts with Existing and Future 

Regulatory Requirements of 
Other Agencies. 

 
Any provisions or limitations of this chapter and 
any rules adopted pursuant hereto are superseded 
and supplemented by any applicable federal, state, 
or local requirements existing or adopted 
subsequent hereto, which are more stringent than 
the provisions and limitations contained herein.  
Any provision of this chapter and rules adopted 
pursuant hereto which are more stringent than any 
such applicable federal, state, or local requirement 
shall prevail and shall be the standard for 
compliance by the connectors to and the 
discharges to the public stormwater system. 
(Ord. No. 1400, Enacted, 10/03/1996) 
 
3.24.021 Accidental Spill Prevention and 

Control. 
 
When the primary function of a business is to 
handle, store, use, dispose or recycle chemicals or 
materials that have the potential to cause or 
contribute to stormwater pollution, especially as 
defined in GRC 3.23.025, the business is required 
to: 
 

(1) Keep a spill containment and cleanup kit 
within the chemical handling or usage area; 

 
(2) Store materials onsite in a manner that 

prevents or limits contact with precipitation on 
anything but clean, non-leaking disposal, 
recycling, or product containers; 
 
 



GRESHAM REVISED CODE 

 (3) 13  

 (3)  Prepare, submit, and maintain an 
Accidental Spill Prevention Plan, upon written 
request by the manager. 

 
If other laws or regulations require an Accidental 
Spill Prevention and Control Plan, a plan that 
meets the requirement of those other laws and 
regulations will satisfy the requirement of this 
section. 
 (Ord. No. 1832, Amended, 09/15/2022; Ord. No. 1790, 
Amended, 01/01/2019; Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 
03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1579, Enacted, 01/01/2004) 
 
3.24.025 Notification of Spills. 
 
As soon as any person in charge of a facility or 
responsible for emergency response for a facility 
becomes aware of any suspected, confirmed, or 
unconfirmed release of material, pollutants, or 
waste creating a risk of discharge to the public 
stormwater system, such persons shall: 
 

(1) begin containment and cleanup 
procedures; 

 
(2) notify emergency personnel in case of an 

emergency; 
 
(3) notify appropriate city officials if a spill 

enters the public stormwater system; 
 
(4) notify Oregon Emergency Response 

System if a spill enters a water body; and 
 
(5) follow-up with the city regarding 

compliance and modified practices to minimize 
future spills, as appropriate. 

 
The notification requirements of this section are in 
addition to any other notification requirements set 
forth in Federal, state, or local regulations and 
laws.  The notification requirements do not relieve 
the person of necessary remediation. 
(Ord. No. 1790, Amended, 01/01/2019; Ord. No. 1400, 
Enacted, 10/03/1996) 
 
3.24.030 Requirement to Eliminate Illicit 

Connections. 
 

(1) The manager may require by written 
notice that a person responsible for an illicit 

connection to the public stormwater system 
comply with the requirements of this chapter to 
eliminate the illicit connection or secure approval 
for the connection by a specified date. 

 
(2) If, subsequent to eliminating a connection 

found to be in violation of the chapter, the 
responsible person can demonstrate that an illicit 
discharge will no longer occur, that person may 
request approval to reconnect.  The reconnection 
or reinstallation of the connection shall be at the 
responsible person’s expense. 
(Ord. No. 1400, Enacted, 10/03/96) 
 
3.24.035 Requirement to Remediate. 
 
Whenever the manager finds that a discharge of 
pollutants is taking place or has taken place which 
will result in or has resulted in pollution of 
stormwater or the public stormwater system, the 
manager may require by written notice to the 
responsible person that the pollution be 
remediated and the affected property restored, to 
the standards established by the manager, within a 
specified time. 
 (Ord. No. 1400, Enacted, 10/03/1996) 
 
3.24.040 Requirement to Monitor and 

Analyze. 
 
Whenever the manager determines that any person 
engaged in any activity and/or owning or 
operating any facility which may cause or 
contribute to stormwater pollution or illicit 
discharges to the public stormwater system, the 
manager may, by written notice, order that such 
person undertake such monitoring activities 
and/or analyses and furnish such reports as the 
manager may deem necessary to demonstrate 
compliance with this chapter.  The written notice 
shall be served either in person or by certified or 
registered mail, return receipt requested, and shall 
set forth the basis for such order and shall 
particularly describe the monitoring activities 
and/or analyses and reports required.  The burden 
to be borne by the owner or operator, including 
costs of these activities, analyses and reports, shall 
bear a reasonable relationship to the need for the 
monitoring, analyses and reports and the benefits 
to be obtained.  The recipient of such order shall 
undertake and provide the monitoring, analyses 
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and reports within the time frames set forth in the 
order. 
 (Ord. No. 1400, Enacted, 10/03/1996) 
 
3.24.045 Stormwater Treatment. 
 
The quality of stormwater leaving the site after 
development shall be equal to or better than the 
quality of stormwater leaving the site before 
development, based on the following criteria: 
 

(1) On-site stormwater management facilities 
for water quality required for development shall 
be designed, installed and maintained in 
accordance with the Stormwater Management 
Manual and the Oregon Plumbing Specialty Code, 
as applicable. 

 
(2) Land use activities of particular concern 

as pollution sources shall implement additional 
Best Management Practices for pollution control, 
including but not limited to, those management 
practices specified in the Stormwater 
Management Manual. 

 
(3) Development in a watershed that drains to 

streams with established Total Maximum Daily 
Load limitations, as provided under the Federal 
Clean Water Act, Oregon Law, Administrative 
Rules and other legal mechanisms shall assure that 
on-site mitigation facilities for water quality 
control meet the requirements for pollutants of 
concern. 
(Ord. No. 1790, Amended, 01/01/2019; Ord. No. 1579, 
Enacted, 01/01/2004) 
 
3.24.050 Design and Performance Criteria 

for Stormwater Detention and 
Water Quality Treatment 
Facilities. 

 
(1) All on-site stormwater management 

facilities including stormwater detention, 
retention, and water quality treatment facilities 
required by the City of Gresham shall be designed 
and constructed to meet the Stormwater 
Management Manual and Oregon Plumbing 
Specialty Code, as applicable.  Stormwater 
facilities that will be publicly maintained shall 
also meet Public Works Standards. 

(2) Except as permitted by the manager as 
provided by the Stormwater Management Manual, 
facilities designed to manage stormwater from 
private properties shall not be located on property 
that is or will become a public right-of-way, public 
stormwater easement, or is within a future street 
plan. 

 
(3) Except as permitted by the manager as 

provided by the Stormwater Management Manual, 
once constructed, the on-site stormwater 
management facilities shall be privately owned, 
operated and maintained.  Maintenance shall 
include all elements of the stormwater detention, 
water quality treatment, and conveyance system 
up to the point of connection with a drainage 
structure or waterway of the public stormwater 
system.  Such connection shall be subject to city 
approval. 

 
(4) Maintenance is required to be performed 

following requirements in the Stormwater 
Management Manual.  Stormwater facilities that 
do not have standard operation and maintenance 
guidelines included in the Stormwater 
Management Manual shall be specified in an 
operation and maintenance plan submitted to and 
approved by the manager prior to the time of 
project acceptance.  When a specific operation and 
maintenance plan is required, the developer or 
applicant shall enter into an agreement with the 
city to ensure the implementation of the operation 
and maintenance plan and a memorandum of 
agreement shall be recorded in the Multnomah 
County deed records. 

 
(5) Private stormwater detention and water 

quality treatment facilities are subject to periodic 
inspection by the city to ensure proper 
maintenance and performance. 

 
(6) Failure to properly operate or maintain on-

site mitigation facilities for stormwater detention, 
retention, and water quality treatment according to 
operation and maintenance requirements in the 
Stormwater Management Manual, a recorded 
maintenance agreement, or GRC Articles 3.20 to 
3.60 is a violation. 
 (Ord. No. 1790, Amended, 01/01/2019; Ord. No. 1700, 
Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1579, Renumbered, 
01/01/2004)
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Article 3.28 

EROSION PREVENTION 

Sections: 

3.28.010 Compliance. 
3.28.015 Inspection. 
 
3.28.010 Compliance. 
 
Any person performing construction work in the 
city shall comply with the provisions of this 
chapter and shall provide and maintain erosion 
and sediment controls that prevent discharges of 
pollutants to the public stormwater system.  Any 
person performing construction work in the city 
shall comply with the Erosion Prevention and 
Sediment Control Manual. 
 (Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1602, 
Amended, 04/01/2005; Ord. No. 1561, Amended, 01/02/2003; 
Ord. No. 1400, Enacted, 10/03/1996) 
 
3.28.015 Inspection. 
 
The manager may make periodic inspections in 
accordance with GRC 7.50.500 through GRC 
7.50.520 to ensure compliance with the 
requirements of the Erosion Prevention and 
Sediment Control Manual. 
 (Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1602, 
Amended, 04/01/2005; Ord. No. 1561, Amended, 
01/02/2003; Ord. No. 1400, Enacted, 10/03/1996) 
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Article 3.30 

CONSTRUCTION PERMIT 

Sections: 

3.30.015 Permit Required. 
3.30.025 Permit Time Limitation. 
3.30.035 Stormwater System Use Permit 

and Inspection Fee. 
 
 

3.30.015 Permit Required. 
 

(1) No person shall uncover, make any 
connections with or openings into, increase the use 
of, alter, or disturb any public stormwater facility 
without first obtaining a permit.  Any work done 
prior to issuance of the permit shall require an 
additional charge as set by council. Payment of 
this additional charge does not excuse full 
compliance with all provisions of this chapter or 
other applicable regulations. 

 
(2) Permit applications shall be made in a 

manner determined  by the city and shall be made 
by the owner or owner’s agent. The permit 
application shall be supplemented by plans, 
specifications, agreements, or other information as 
required by the manager. 

 
(3)  A permit is specific to the property for 

which it is issued and is not transferable to other 
property. 

 
(4) A permit shall not be issued until all 

charges have been paid. 
 
(5) Prior to or concurrent with obtaining a 

permit, the applicant shall also obtain any permits 
that may be required for street or highway opening 
and use. 
 (Ord. No. 1822, Amended, 11/08/2021; Ord. No. 1700, 
Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1561, Amended, 01/02/2003; 
Ord. No. 1293, Enacted, 07/01/1994) 
 
3.30.025 Permit Time Limitation. 
 

(1) A permit is valid for 180 calendar days 
from the date the permit is issued. 

 

(2) Upon written request by the applicant, the 
manager may extend the permit. 
 (Ord. No. 1822, Amended, 11/08/2021; Ord. No. 1750, 
Amended, 05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1293, Enacted, 07/01/1994) 
 

3.30.035 Stormwater Connection Fee. 
 
Applicants constructing a new stormwater 
connection shall pay to the city the stormwater 
connection fees and other related fees and charges.    
Connection fees shall be set by council resolution.   
 (Ord. No. 1822, Amended, 11/08/2021; Ord. No. 1787, 
Amended, 11/01/2018; Ord. No. 1534, Amended, 
11/01/2001; Ord. No. 1379, Amended, 12/07/1995; Ord. No. 
1293, Enacted, 07/01/1994) 
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Article 3.60 

STORMWATER USER CHARGE 

Sections: 

3.60.015 Stormwater User Charge. 
3.60.025 Basis of Charge. 
3.60.035 Calculation of Charge. 
3.60.045 Reducing Stormwater Charges. 
3.60.055 Stormwater Utility Fund. 
3.60.065 Billing. 
3.60.075 Payment. 
3.60.080 Property Liens. 
3.60.085 Adjustment of Accounts. 
3.60.095 Delinquency. 
3.60.097 Tenant Accounts. 
3.60.100 Administrative Regulations. 
3.60.120 Recovery of Delinquent Charges. 
 
3.60.015 Stormwater User Charge. 
 
Stormwater customers who use the public 
stormwater system or who cause or permit the 
discharge of net stormwater runoff directly or 
indirectly into the public stormwater system shall 
pay a stormwater user charge.  It is presumed that 
stormwater services are used whenever the 
stormwater customer's property is an improved 
property.  The State of Oregon is exempt from the 
stormwater user charge for all highway and road 
improvements within its rights-of-way.  The State 
shall pay stormwater user charges for all other 
property it owns within Gresham. 
 

(1) Stormwater user charges and 
methodology shall be established by council 
resolution. 

 
(2) User charges shall reflect actual costs of 

Stormwater Service including operation, 
maintenance, replacement, and capital 
improvements.   
 (Ord. No. 1851, Amended, 10/17/2024; Ord. No. 1822, 
Amended, 11/08/2021; Ord. No. 1750, Amended, 
05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1359, Amended, 05/18/1995; Ord. No. 
1293, Enacted, 07/01/1994) 
 
3.60.025 Basis of Charge. 
 
Stormwater user charges shall be based on the 

amount of the impervious surface on the 
stormwater customer's property.   Council may 
take into consideration water quality as well as 
water quantity when establishing the charge. 
 

(1) The city will assume that the impervious 
area for single detached dwelling units existing 
prior to July 1, 1994, is 2,500 square feet. 

 
(2) The city will assume that the impervious 

area for all other development, other than new 
single detached dwelling units, is the actual 
measured impervious area. 

 
(3) The city will assume that the impervious 

area for new single detached dwelling units is the 
approximate impervious area determined by a 
formula based on the area of the building 
footprint. 
 (Ord. No. 1832, Amended, 09/15/2022; Ord. No. 1822, 
Amended, 11/08/2021; Ord. No. 1379, Amended, 
12/07/1995; Ord. No. 1334, Amended, 11/03/1994; Ord. No. 
1293, Enacted, 07/01/1994) 
 
3.60.035 Calculation of Charge. 
 

(1) Stormwater user charges for all new 
development and for existing improved properties 
shall be calculated by dividing the impervious area 
on the stormwater customer's property by one 
drainage residential unit (2,500 square feet) and 
multiplying that number by the rate set for one 
drainage residential unit. 

 
(a) The impervious areas for improved 

properties, other than for single detached 
dwelling units, existing on July 1, 1994, which 
was the original effective date of this section, 
were individually measured through the use of 
any combination of the following: aerial 
photographs and computer analysis, actual 
measurement of impervious area, and 
calculations from city approved site plans. 
Single detached dwellings, were assigned one 
drainage residential unit of impervious area. 

 
(b) For all multifamily and non-

residential uses, the applicant shall calculate 
the impervious area from city-approved site 
plans.  The city shall review and approve the 
calculations. 
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 (c) For new single detached dwelling 

units and middle housing units, impervious 
area shall be calculated in accordance with the 
adopted Council fee resolution. 

 
(d) A stormwater customer may submit to 

the manager a request to be charged based on 
actual measured impervious area.  The city 
shall charge the customer the associated 
administrative costs of measuring the actual 
impervious area and the cost of applying the 
charge. 

 
(e) The city may choose to base a 

customer's stormwater user charge on actual 
measured impervious area. 

 (Ord. No. 1832, Amended, 09/15/2022; Ord. No. 1822, 
Amended, 11/08/2021; Ord. No. 1379, Amended, 
12/07/1995; Ord. No. 1334, Amended, 11/03/1994; Ord. No. 
1293, Enacted, 07/01/1994) 
 
3.60.045 Reducing Stormwater Charges. 
 

(1) Reducing Stormwater Charges.  
Stormwater customers may reduce their 
stormwater charges by: 

 
(a) Eliminating the impervious area on 

their property.    The city will reduce a 
stormwater customer's user charges if the 
customer is able to demonstrate to the 
manager's satisfaction that effective 
impervious area of a site has been decreased 
through the removal of impervious area and/or 
impervious area has been replaced with an 
approved impervious area reduction technique 
(i.e., installation of pervious pavement). 

 
(b) Installing city-approved on-site 

stormwater management facilities.  The on-
site portion of the stormwater fee will be  

 
reduced if the stormwater customer can 
demonstrate to the manager's satisfaction: 

 
(i) that their property retains all of 

the net stormwater runoff on-site and 
discharges no net stormwater runoff to the 
public stormwater system, even during 
major storm events, and 

 
(ii) that they do not adversely affect 

groundwater, surface water, or 
stormwater quality directly or indirectly 
as a result of on-site activities or the 
improper use of on-site stormwater 
management facilities. 

 
(c) By other means as described in the 

current applicable fee resolution. 
 

(2) Application to Reduce Stormwater 
Charges. Stormwater customers interested in 
reducing their stormwater charges shall submit to 
the manager appropriate evidence as to why their 
stormwater charges should be reduced. The 
customer shall pay an application fee established 
by council resolution. When a site is being fully 
developed or redeveloped and is infiltrating 100%, 
the reduction will be applied administratively 
without an application process or fee. 

 
(a) Any reductions shall continue until 

the condition on the property is changed or 
until the city determines the property no 
longer qualifies for the reduction. 

 
(b) All on-site stormwater management 

facilities eligible for discount must be 
designed, constructed, and maintained to 
standards contained in the Stormwater 
Management Manual and the Oregon 
Plumbing Specialty Code, as applicable.   

 (Ord. No. 1832, Amended, 09/15/2022; Ord. No. 1822, 
Amended, 11/08/2021; Ord. No. 1790, Amended, 
01/01/2019; Ord. No. 1379, Amended, 12/07/1995; Ord. No. 
1317, Amended, 07/01/1994; Ord. No. 1293, Enacted, 
07/01/1994) 
 
3.60.055 Stormwater Utility Fund. 
 

(1) There shall be a stormwater utility fund.  
Except for system development charges, all 
charges imposed and collected under this chapter 
shall be deposited in the stormwater utility fund. 

 
(2) Money in the stormwater utility fund shall 

be used for planning, designing, and constructing 
the public stormwater system; for the regulation, 
maintenance, and administration of the public 
stormwater system; for providing all stormwater 
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services, including the repayment of any 
indebtedness incurred before or after the effective 
date of this ordinance; and for all expenses related 
to the operation and management of the 
stormwater utility. 
 (Ord. No. 1787, Amended, 11/01/2018; Ord. No. 1561, 
Amended, 01/02/2003; Ord. No. 1293, Enacted, 07/01/1994) 
 
3.60.065 Billing. 
 

(1) The city shall bill user charges on a 
schedule approved by the manager. 

 
(2) Stormwater user charges may be billed on 

the same bill with water user charges and 
wastewater user charges, but shall not be 
combined. 
 (Ord. No. 1440, Amended, 04/16/1998; Ord. No. 1293, 
Enacted, 07/01/1994) 
 
3.60.075 Payment. 
 

(1) 
 

(a) Initial stormwater user charges begin 
when a building permit is issued or 
impervious surface is constructed, whichever 
is first.  Charges shall be based on the planned 
or constructed impervious area.  The manager 
may delay the commencement of these 
charges if the customer demonstrates hardship 
or special circumstances that warrant a delay. 

 
(b) For existing multifamily and non-

residential uses  annexed into the city on or 
after January 1, 2006, stormwater user charges 
begin concurrently with the obligation to 
connect to sanitary sewerage system as 
provided in GRC 4.15.010(1).  The manager 
may phase in the amount of the user charge 
based on the level of service provided.  The 
stormwater user charges for single detached 
dwellings and middle housing units  existing 
at the time of annexation will be treated as 
development existing prior to 1994. 

 
(2) When the customer changes, user charges 

for the new customer begins when new customer 
information is received by the city.  If notification 
of the change was not received by the city prior to 
the change in customer, the user charge shall begin  

with the next billing and the new customer may be 
billed retroactively, not to exceed one year. 

 
(3) If two or more persons are billed for 

service, they shall be jointly and individually 
liable and sent a single bill. 

 
(4) Payments shall be applied as provided by 

GRC 2.92.090. 
 
(5) Stormwater user charges shall be paid 

within 26 days from the service period ending date 
on the regular bill. 

 
(6) Closing bills shall be computed within 

two weeks after the stormwater customer notifies 
the city that he or she is no longer the person 
responsible for the charge. 
 (Ord. No. 1832, Amended, 09/15/2022; Ord. No. 1647, 
Amended, 09/20/2007; Ord. No. 1602, Amended, 
04/01/2005; Ord. No. 1561, Amended, 01/02/2003; Ord. No. 
1534, Amended, 11/01/2001; Ord. No. 1293, Enacted, 
07/01/1994) 
 

3.60.080 Property Liens. 
 

(1) If the stormwater customer is also the 
owner of the property, user charges plus billing 
service charges, late payment charge, charge for 
collecting delinquent bills, damages, charges for 
costs incurred by the city for cleaning, repair, or 
replacement work caused by violation of this 
chapter, and any other stormwater charges 
incurred related to the property, shall be a lien 
against the property served from the date of 
delinquency.  In the case of a closing bill where 
the property is being sold or transferred, the lien 
for the closing bill shall attach as of the day 
preceding the sale or transfer. 

 
(2) When a bill for stormwater service 

remains unpaid for 60 days after it has been 
entered in the customers billing record or other 
city stormwater record, and recorded in the city’s 
lien docket, the lien may be foreclosed in any 
manner provided by ORS 223.505 to ORS 
223.650, or as otherwise provided by law. 
 (Ord. No. 1602, Amended, 04/01/2005; Ord. No. 1561, 
Enacted, 01/02/2003) 
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3.60.085 Adjustment of Accounts. 
 
Stormwater customers may request in writing a 
review of their user charge if they feel they are 
being incorrectly charged.  The manager may 
initiate the review of a customer’s stormwater user 
charge. 
 

 (1) If a customer’s charge is reduced as a 
result of this review, the corrected stormwater user 
charge shall begin with the next billing and a credit 
or refund shall be made retroactively, not to 
exceed one year from the last billing. 

 
(2) If a customer’s charge is increased as a 

result of this review, the corrected stormwater user 
charge shall begin with the next billing and the 
customer shall be billed for the increase 
retroactively, not to exceed one year from the last 
billing. 

 
(3) If a customer receives other than the 

normal number of days of storm water services, 
the city shall prorate the storm water user charge. 

 
(4) The manager may write off closed 

accounts and retroactive bills if in the best interest 
of the city and may write off refunds, unless the 
customer requested otherwise, if the cost of 
making the refund would exceed the amount of the 
refund. 

 
(5) If a customer has not been billed for 

stormwater service, the stormwater user charge 
shall begin with the next billing and the customer 
shall be billed, retroactively, not to exceed one 
year. 
 (Ord. No. 1561, Amended, 01/02/2003; Ord. No. 1440, 
Amended, 04/16/1998; Ord. No. 1379, Amended, 
12/07/1995; Ord. No. 1293, Enacted, 07/01/1994) 
 
3.60.095 Delinquency. 
 

(1) Stormwater user charges are delinquent if 
payment in full is not received by the city within 
26 days from the service period ending date on the 
regular bill. 

 
(2) If a customer account for stormwater user 

charges is delinquent, the city may discontinue 
any city provided water service billed to that 

customer.  The city will follow the procedures 
identified in GRC 5.99.040. 

 
(3) The council may establish by resolution 

fees for extra services required in collecting 
delinquent customer accounts for user charges. 

 
(4) The city may refuse to restore water 

service to the premises until the delinquent 
charges and other costs incurred are paid. 
 (Ord. No. 1750, Amended, 05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1602, 
Amended, 04/01/2005; Ord. No. 1561, Amended, 01/02/2003; 
Ord. No. 1534, Amended, 11/01/2001; Ord. No. 1440, 
Amended, 04/16/1998; Ord. No. 1379, Amended, 12/07/1995; 
Ord. No. 1293, Enacted, 07/01/1994) 
 
3.60.097 Tenant Accounts. 

 
(1) The city's claim against a tenant is 

transferred to the owner of the property when the 
city provides notice of the delinquent status to the 
tenant and mails a copy of the notice of 
delinquency by first class mail to the last address 
of the owner or owner's agent that is on file with 
the city, within 30 days from the time the payment 
is due on the account.  The transferred claim shall 
be a lien against the property served from the date 
of the notice of delinquency is mailed to the owner 
of the property.  The transfer does not relieve the 
tenant of the obligation to pay the claim. 

 
(2) The city may refuse to provide water 

service to a tenant if the tenant has a previous 
unpaid utility bill with the city unless the city and 
the tenant agree to a plan for repayment of unpaid 
utility bills. 

 
(3) The city will provide information to the 

owner or owner's agent regarding the status of a 
tenant's account upon request, within a reasonable 
amount of time.  If a request is made verbally, the 
city shall provide the information verbally.  If the 
city discloses information under this subsection, 
the city shall not be held responsible for the 
disclosure of information to a person who is not an 
owner or owner's agent. 
 (Ord. No. 1750, Amended, 05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1602, 
Enacted, 04/01/2005) 
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3.60.100 Administrative Regulations. 
 
The manager may adopt such rules and regulations 
as are necessary for the administration of the 
duties required by this chapter and for the:  a) 
public health and safety, b) the environment, or c) 
both; and welfare. 
 (Ord. No. 1750, Amended, 05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1293, 
Enacted, 07/01/1994) 
 
3.60.120 Recovery of Delinquent Charges. 
 
For those accounts where the city does not have 
the ability to collect stormwater charges in 
connection with or as part of the charge for another 
service or utility that can be curtailed to secure 
collection, the city may certify to the tax assessor 
of Multnomah County the amount of any 
delinquent user charges, fees for collecting 
delinquent user charges, and billing service 
charges.  When so certified, they shall be assessed 
against the premises served in the same manner as 
other taxes are certified, assessed, collected, and 
paid. 
 (Ord. No. 1750, Enacted, 05/07/2015) 
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Article 3.99  

ENFORCEMENT 

 
Sections: 
 
3.99.010 Violation. 
3.99.020 Authority to Inspect. 
3.99.030 Acts Resulting in Violation of 

Federal Law.  
3.99.040 Fines, Penalties and Other 

Enforcement Tools. 
3.99.050 Disclaimer of Liability. 
 
 
3.99.010 Violation. 
 
A violation shall have occurred when any 
requirement or provision of GRC Articles 3.20 to 
3.60 has not been complied with.  Violation of any 
provision of GRC Articles 3.20 to 3.60 may be 
subject to enforcement action by the manager. 
 (Ord. No. 1700, Enacted, 03/03/2011) 
 

3.99.020 Authority to Inspect. 
 

(1) The manager may enter any property, 
building or premises in accordance with GRC 
7.50.500 through GRC 7.50.520, to perform an 
inspection to ensure compliance with any 
provision of GRC Articles 3.20 to 3.60. 

 
(2) As used in this section, inspection 

includes, but is not limited to, physical inspection, 
sampling, metering or recording on site activities, 
or reviewing and copying records, all as necessary 
to ensure compliance with GRC Articles 3.20 to 
3.60. 
 (Ord. No. 1700, Enacted, 03/03/2011) 
 
3.99.030 Acts Resulting in Violation of 

Federal Law. 
 
Any person who violates any provision of GRC 
Articles 3.20 to 3.60 or the Stormwater 
Management Manual, or any provision of any 
stormwater-related permit issued by DEQ, or who 
discharges waste or wastewater which causes 
pollution, or who violates any cease and desist 

order, prohibition, or effluent limitation, also may 
be in violation of the federal Clean Water Act, 
Safe Drinking Water Act or the Endangered 
Species Act and may be subject to the sanctions of 
these Acts including civil and criminal penalties. 
 (Ord. No. 1700, Enacted, 03/03/2011) 
 

3.99.040 Fines, Penalties and Other 
Enforcement Tools. 

 
(1) Any condition caused or permitted to exist 

in violation of any provision of GRC Articles 3.20 
to 3.60 is a threat to:  a) public health and safety, 
b) the environment, or c) both.  Any such 
condition is unlawful and constitutes a nuisance. 

 
(2) In addition to any other remedies provided 

herein, violation of any section of GRC Articles 
3.20 to 3.60 may be enforced as set forth in GRC 
Article 7.50, or as otherwise authorized by law. 

 
(3) Unless otherwise specified, violation of 

any provision of GRC Articles 3.20 to 3.60 may 
be subject to a fine or penalty in the maximum 
amount of $5,000. 

 
(4) Each day on which a violation occurs or 

continues is a separate offense and may be subject 
to a separate fine or penalty.    
 (Ord. No. 1750, Amended, 05/06/2015; Ord. No. 1700, 
Enacted, 03/03/2011) 
 

3.99.050 Disclaimer of Liability. 
 
The degree of protection required by GRC 
Articles 3.20 to 3.60 is considered reasonable for 
regulatory purposes and is based on scientific, 
engineering, and other relevant technical 
considerations.  The standards set forth herein are 
minimum standards and compliance does not 
ensure that there will be no unauthorized 
discharge of pollutants into the public stormwater 
system.  GRC Articles 3.20 to 3.60 shall not create 
liability on the part of the city, any agent or 
employee thereof for any damages that result from 
reliance on GRC Articles 3.20 to 3.60 or any 
administrative decision lawfully made thereunder. 
 (Ord. No. 1700, Enacted, 03/03/2011) 
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