GRESHAM REVISED CODE

Chapter 10
BUILDINGS AND HOUSING

Articles:

10.05 BUILDING CODES

10.05.010 Title.

10.05.020 Purpose.

10.05.030 Scope.

10.05.040 Definitions.

10.05.050 Adoption of Oregon Structural
Specialty Code.

10.05.060 Adoption of Oregon Mechanical
Specialty Code.

10.05.070 Adoption of Oregon Plumbing
Specialty Code.

10.05.080 Adoption of Oregon Electrical
Specialty Code.

10.05.090 Adoption of Oregon Residential
Specialty Code.

10.05.095 Adoption of Oregon Energy
Efficiency Specialty Code.

10.05.100 Adoption of Oregon Manufactured
Dwelling and Park Specialty
Code.

10.05.105 Adoption of the Oregon Solar
Installation Specialty Code.

10.05.110 Amendment of Administrative
Provisions.

10.05.120 Building Official Connection after
Order to Disconnect.

10.05.125 Violation.

10.05.130 Local Appeals.

10.05.140 Liability.

10.05.150 Permit Expiration Extension and
Reinstatement.

10.05.160 Permit Not Transferable.

10.05.170 Inspections.

10.05.180 Fees.

10.05.190 Severability.

10.05.200 Enforcement.

10.15 BUILDING PERMITS

10.15.010 Payment Required.
10.15.020 Payment of Charqges.

(10) 1

10.20 BURGLARY AND ROBBERY

10.20.010
10.20.020
10.20.030
10.20.040
10.20.050
10.20.060
10.20.070
10.20.080

10.20.090
10.20.100
10.20.110
10.20.120

10.20.130
10.20.140

ALARM SYSTEMS

Purpose and Scope.

Definition.

Alarm Users Permit Required.

Fees for Excessive False Alarms.

No Response to Excessive Alarms.

Special Permits.

User Instructions.

Automatic Dialing Device; Certain
Interconnections Prohibited.

Hearing.

Sound Emission Cutoff Feature.

Confidentiality; Statistics.

Allocation of Revenues and

Expenses.

Interpretation.
Enforcement.

10.25 FIRE AND LIFE SAFETY CODE

10.25.010

10.25.020
10.25.030

10.25.070
10.25.080
10.25.090
10.25.100

Adoption of Fire and Life Safety
Code.

Definitions.

Establishment and Duties of Life
Safety Division.

Amendments to the Fire Code.

Appeals.

Fire Safety Inspection Program.

Fines and Penalties.

10.26 FEIRE ALARM SYSTEMS

10.26.010
10.26.020
10.26.025
10.26.030
10.26.040
10.26.050

Purpose and Scope.

Definitions.

Violation.

Fines for Excessive False Alarms.

Hearing.
Enforcement.

10.27 PERMIT-REQUIRED CONFINED

10.27.010

10.27.020
10.27.030

SPACE RESCUE

Permit-Required Confined Space
Rescue.

Subscriber Fee.

Non-subscriber Fee.




GRESHAM REVISED CODE

10.30 PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

10.30.010
10.30.020
10.30.025
10.30.030
10.30.033

Short Title.

Purpose.

Definitions.

Scope and Application.

Exterior Conditions and Derelict
Structures.

Adoption of International Property
Maintenance Code.

Responsibility.

Modifications.

Emergency Repair.

Weather Proofing and Screens.

Derelict Structures Prohibited.

Inspection of Property in Default.

Closing and Securing Derelict
Structures.

Derelict Structure Registration.

Complaint Process.

Temporary Waivers of
Enforcement Action.

Hardship Waivers of Enforcement
Action.

Enforcement.

Receivership Authority.

Lien.

Application of Other Codes.

Coordination of Enforcement.

Decommissioning and Removal of
Renewable Energy Systems.

10.30.035

10.30.060
10.30.070
10.30.140
10.30.170
10.30.200
10.30.205
10.30.210

10.30.220
10.30.230
10.30.270

10.30.280

10.30.290
10.30.310
10.30.320
10.30.340
10.30.360
10.30.400

10.50 PROPERTY TAX EXEMPTION FOR

NEW, TRANSIT SUPPORTIVE,
MULTIPLE-UNIT HOUSING
OR MIXED USE
DEVELOPMENT

10.50.155 Continuation of Prior Exemption.

10.60 MARINAS AND FLOATING
STRUCTURES

10.60.010
10.60.020
10.60.030
10.60.040
10.60.050

Statement of Purpose and Intent.

Scope.

Definitions.

Administration and Enforcement.

Requlations for Floating
Structures.

(10) 2

10.60.060 Regulations Pertaining to Floating
Homes, Combos, Boat Houses
and Related Accessory
Structures.

Construction Other than Floating
Homes.

Engineered Construction.

Electrical Installations.

Plumbing Installations.

Mechanical Installations.

10.60.070

10.60.080
10.60.090
10.60.100
10.60.110

10.70 MOVING OF BUILDINGS

10.70.010
10.70.020

Movement of Buildings.
Moving of Buildings, Permits

Required.
Liability.
Movement on State Highways.
Enforcement.

10.70.030
10.70.040
10.70.050

10.99 ENFORCEMENT

10.99.010 Violation.

10.99.020 Authority to Inspect.

10.99.030 Fines, Penalties and Other
Enforcement Tools.




GRESHAM REVISED CODE

Article 10.05
BUILDING CODES
Sections:

10.05.010 Title.

10.05.020 Purpose.

10.05.030 Scope.

10.05.040 Definitions.

10.05.050 Adoption of Oregon Structural
Specialty Code.

10.05.060 Adoption of Oregon Mechanical
Specialty Code.

10.05.070 Adoption of Oregon Plumbing
Specialty Code.

10.05.080 Adoption of Oregon Electrical
Specialty Code.

10.05.090 Adoption of Oregon Residential
Specialty Code.

10.05.095 Adoption of Oregon Energy
Efficiency Specialty Code.

10.05.100 Adoption of Oregon Manufactured
Dwelling and Park Specialty
Code.

10.05.105 Adoption of the Oregon Solar
Installation Specialty Code.

10.05.110 Amendment of Administrative
Provisions.

10.05.120 Building Official Connection after
Order to Disconnect.

10.05.125 Violation.

10.05.130 Local Appeals.

10.05.140 Liability.

10.05.150 Permit Expiration Extension and
Reinstatement.

10.05.160 Permit Not Transferable.

10.05.170 Inspections.

10.05.180 Fees.

10.05.190 Severability.

10.05.200 Enforcement.

10.05.010 Title.

These regulations shall be known as The City of
Gresham Building Code, may be cited as such and

will be referred to herein as "this code."
(Ord. No. 1607, Repealed/Replaced, 07/21/2005; Ord. No.
1424, Amended, 07/17/1997)

(10) 3

10.05.020 Purpose.

The purpose of this code is to establish uniform
performance standards providing reasonable
safeguards for health, safety, welfare, comfort and
security of the residents of this city who are
occupants and users of buildings and for the use of
modern methods, devices, materials, techniques

and practicable maximum energy conservation.
(Ord. No. 1607, Repealed/Replaced, 07/21/2005; Ord. No.
1424, Amended, 07/17/1997)

10.05.030 Scope.

(1) This code shall apply to the construction,
erection, alteration, moving, enlargement,
demolition, repair, improvement, conversion,
maintenance and work associated with any
building or structure except those located in a
public way.

(2) Where, in any specific case, different
sections of this code specify different materials,
methods of construction or other requirements, the
most restrictive shall govern. Where there is a
conflict between a general requirement and a
specific requirement, the specific requirement
shall be applicable.

(3) Where, in any specific case, there is a
conflict between this code and Oregon Revised

Statutes, the statute shall govern.
(Ord. No. 1607, Repealed/Replaced, 07/21/2005; Ord. No.
1424, Amended, 07/17/1997)

10.05.040 Definitions.

In addition to the definitions set forth in GRC
1.05.010, for the purpose of the code, the
following definition shall apply:

Building Official. Shall mean the City Building

Official or designee.

(Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1607,
Repealed/Replaced, 07/21/2005; Ord. No. 1424, Amended,
07/17/1997)




GRESHAM REVISED CODE

10.05.050 Adoption of the Oregon Structural
Specialty Code.

(1) The Oregon Structural Specialty Code, as
adopted by OAR Chapter 918, as amended or
revised by the State of Oregon, and except as
modified by GRC 10.05.110, is adopted and
enforced as part of GRC Article 10.05.

(2) Grading: Appendix J of the Oregon
Structural Specialty Code, as amended or revised
by the State of Oregon, and except as modified in
this code, is adopted and enforced as part of GRC
Acrticle 10.05.

(3) The provisions of the Oregon Structural
Specialty Code, in addition to its individual
scoping provisions, shall also apply to demolition
of structures, equipment and systems regulated by
the Oregon Structural Specialty Code.

(4) Application and Permits: (OSSC 104.2)
The building official shall receive applications,
review construction documents and issue permits
for the erection, and alteration, demolition and
moving of buildings and structures, inspect the
premises for which such permits have been issued
and enforce compliance with the provision of the
Oregon Structural Specialty Code or other local
ordinances.

(5) The following shall be regulated by the
Oregon Structural Specialty Code, except as
modified in this code, and enforced as part of GRC
Article 10.05:

(a) Signs: Appendix H of the Oregon
Structural Specialty Code, as amended or
revised by the State of Oregon.

(b) Tanks:

(i) Tanks that contain, house or
support  water or  fire-suppression
material, or equipment required for the
protection of essential or hazardous
facilities or special occupancy structures.

(10) 4

(i) Tanks that are
supporting, or containing
explosive substances.

(c) Monopoles: Cellular phone, radio, and
other telecommunication and broadcast
towers.

(d  Ground-mounted  photovoltaic:
Ground-mounter photovoltaic systems over
10 feet in height measured to the highest point
of installation.

housing,
toxic or

(e) Fences: Fences over 7 feet in height.
(f) Retaining Walls:

(i) Retaining walls over 4 feet in
height measured from the bottom of the
footing to the top of the wall.

(ii) Retaining walls located adjacent
to a building or structure a distance of no

more than 2 times the height of the wall.
(Ord. No. 1822, Amended, 11/08/2021; Ord. No. 1756,
Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1607, Repealed/Replaced,
07/21/2005; Ord. No. 1424, Enacted, 07/17/1997; Ord. No.
1490, Amended, 01/18/2000)

10.05.060 Adoption of the Oregon
Mechanical Specialty Code.

The Oregon Mechanical Specialty Code, as
adopted by OAR Chapter 918, as amended or
revised by the State of Oregon, and except as
modified in this code, is adopted and enforced as

part of GRC Atrticle 10.05.

(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1607,
Repealed/Replaced, 07/21/2005; Ord. No. 1424, Enacted,
07/17/1997)

10.05.070 Adoption of the Oregon Plumbing
Specialty Code.

The Oregon Plumbing Specialty Code, as adopted
by OAR Chapter 918, as amended or revised by
the State of Oregon, and except as modified in this
code, is adopted and enforced as part of GRC
Acticle 10.05.

(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1607,

Repealed/Replaced, 07/21/2005; Ord. No. 1424, Enacted,
07/17/1997)



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

10.05.080 Adoption of the Oregon Electrical
Specialty Code.

The Oregon Electrical Specialty Code, as adopted
by OAR Chapter 918, as amended or revised by
the State of Oregon, and except as modified in this
code, is adopted and enforced as part of GRC
Avrticle 10.05.

(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1607,

Repealed/Replaced, 07/21/2005; Ord. No. 1424, Enacted,
07/17/1997)

10.05.090 Adoption of the Oregon
Residential Specialty Code.

(1) The Oregon Residential Specialty Code,
as adopted by OAR Chapter 918, as amended or
revised by the State of Oregon, and except as
modified in this code, is adopted and enforced as
part of GRC Avrticle 10.05.

(2) The provisions of the Oregon Residential
Specialty Code, in addition to its individual
scoping provisions, shall also apply to demolition
of structures, equipment and systems regulated by
the Oregon Residential Specialty Code.

(3) Application and Permits: (ORSC 104.2)
The building official shall receive applications,
review construction documents and issue permits
for the erection, and alteration, demolition and
moving of buildings and structures, inspect the
premises for which such permits have been issued
and enforce compliance with the provision of the
Oregon Structural Specialty Code or other local
ordinances.

(4) The following shall be regulated by the
Oregon Residential Specialty Code, except as
modified in this code, and enforced as part of GRC
Avrticle 10.05:

(@  Ground-mounted  photovoltaic:
Ground-mounter photovoltaic systems over
10 feet in height measured to the highest point
of installation.

(b) Fences: Fences over 7 feet in height.

(c) Retaining Walls:

(10) 5

(i) Retaining walls over 4 feet in
height measured from the bottom of the
footing to the top of the wall.

(ii) Retaining walls located adjacent
to a building or structure a distance of no

more than 2 times the height of the wall.
(Ord. No. 1822, Amended, 11/08/2021; Ord. No. 1756,
Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1607, Repealed/Replaced,
07/21/2005; Ord. No. 1424, Enacted, 07/17/1997)

10.05.095 Adoption of the Oregon Energy
Efficiency Specialty Code.

The Oregon Energy Efficiency Special Code, as
adopted by OAR Chapter 918, as amended or
revised by the State of Oregon, and except as
modified by this code, is adopted and enforced as

part of GRC Atrticle 10.05.
(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1688,
Enacted, 07/01/2010)

10.05.100 Adoption of the Oregon
Manufactured Dwelling and
Park Specialty Code.

(1) Parks: The manufactured dwelling park
and mobile home park rules adopted by OAR
Chapter 918, as amended or revised by the State
of Oregon, and except as modified in this code, are
adopted and enforced as part of GRC Article
10.05.

(2) Manufactured Home Installations: The
manufactured dwelling rules adopted by OAR
Chapter 918, as amended or revised by the State
of Oregon, and except as modified in this code, are
adopted and enforced as part of GRC Article
10.05.

(3) Recreational Park and Organization Camp
Regulations: The recreational park and
organizational camp rules adopted by OAR
Chapter 918, as amended or revised by the State
of Oregon, and except as modified in this code, are
adopted and enforced as part of GRC Article

10.05.

(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1607,
Repealed/Replaced, 07/21/2005; Ord. No. 1424, Enacted,
07/17/1997)



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

10.05.105 Adoption of the Oregon Solar
Specialty Code.

The Oregon Solar Installation Specialty Code, as
adopted by OAR Chapter 918 as amended or
revised by the State of Oregon, and except as
modified in this code, is adopted and enforced as

part of GRC Atrticle 10.05.
(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1699,
Enacted, 10/01/2010)

10.05.110 Amendment of Administrative
Provisions.

(1) The following administrative sections of
Chapter 1 of the Oregon Structural Specialty Code
are supplemented by this code as follows:

(a) Section 104.4, Inspection, is
supplemented by GRC 10.05.170,
Inspections.

(b) Section 104.6, Right of Entry, is
supplemented by GRC 7.50.500 to 7.50.520
relating to Permit and Licensure Inspections.

(c) Section  104.8, Liability, is
supplemented by GRC 10.05.140, Liability.
(d) Section 105.5, Expiration, is

supplemented by GRC 10.05.150, Permit
Expiration Extension and Reinstatement.

(e) Section 109, Fees, is supplemented by
GRC 10.05.180, Fees.

(f) Section 113, Board of Appeals, is
supplemented by GRC 10.05.130. Local
Appeals.

(g) Section 114,  Violations, is
supplemented by GRC 10.05.125, Violation,
and 10.05.200, Enforcement.

(h) Section 115, Stop Work Order, is
supplemented by GRC 7.50.100 to 7.50.160
relating to Stop Work Orders.

(2) In the event of any conflict between the
Oregon Structural Specialty Code and the
Gresham Revised Code provisions described in

(10) 6

GRC 10.05.110(1), the provisions of the Gresham

Revised Code shall prevail.
(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1684,
Amended, 02/18/2010; Ord. No. 1607, Enacted, 07/21/2005)

10.05.120 Building Official Connection after
Order to Disconnect.

Connection after Order to Disconnect: No person
shall make a connection to or from an energy, fuel
or power supply to any equipment regulated by
this code which has been disconnected or ordered
disconnected or discontinued by the building
official until the building official specifically
authorizes the reconnection and/or use of such
equipment.

(Ord. No. 1607, Repealed/Replaced, 07/21/2005; Ord. No.
1424, Enacted, 07/17/1997)

10.05.125 Violation.

No person shall engage in any of the prohibited

acts described in ORS 455.450 and 455.453.
(Ord. No. 1756, Enacted, 08/20/2015)

10.05.130 Local Appeals.

@ The Assistant Building Official or
designee shall review any appeal of a plans
examiner or inspector. The appeal may be verbal
or in writing. The appeal must be made within 48
hours of the decision. There is no cost for this
appeal. A decision will generally be issued within
24 hours of the appeal.

(2) The Building Official shall review any
appeal of an Assistant Building Official decision.
The appeal must be in writing. The appeal must be
made within 72 hours of the decision. There is no
cost for this appeal. A written decision will
generally be issued within 48 hours of the appeal.

(3) Persons aggrieved by a decision of the
Building Official may appeal to the State of
Oregon in accordance with ORS 455.475.

(Ord. No. 1770, Amended, 03/23/2017; Ord. No. 1700,

Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1607, Repealed/Replaced,
07/21/2005; Ord. No. 1424, Enacted, 07/17/1997)



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

10.05.140 Liability.

(1) The building official charged with the
enforcement of this code, acting in good faith and
without malice in the discharge of the duties
required by this code or other pertinent law or
ordinance shall not thereby be rendered personally
liable for damages that may accrue to persons or
property as a result of an act or by reason of an act
or omission in the discharge of such duties. A suit
brought against the building official or employee
because of such act or omission performed by the
building official or employee in the enforcement
of any provision of such codes or other pertinent
laws or ordinances implemented through the
enforcement of this code or enforced by the code
enforcement agency shall be defended by this city
until final termination of such proceedings, and
any judgment resulting therefrom shall be
assumed by the city.

(2) This code shall not be construed to relieve
from or lessen the responsibility of any non-city
agent or employee, including but not limited to
any builder, contractor, agent or employee of any
builder or contractor or any person owning,
operating or controlling any building or structure,
for any damages to persons or property caused by
defects, nor shall the code enforcement agency or
the city be held as assuming any such liability by
reason of the inspections authorized by this code
or any permits or certificates issued under this

code.
(Ord. No. 1607, Repealed/Replaced, 07/21/2005; Ord. No.
1424, Enacted, 07/17/1997)

10.05.150 Permit Expiration Extension and
Reinstatement.

(1) Every permit issued by the building
official shall expire by limitation and become null
and void 24 months after the date of permit
issuance. If the building or work authorized by
such permit has not received final inspection
approval prior to the permit expiration date, all
work shall stop until a new permit is obtained for
the value of the work remaining unfinished.
However, at the time of permit issuance the
building official may approve a period exceeding
24 months for completion of work when the

(10) 7

permittee  submits a report in  writing
demonstrating that the complexity or size of the
project makes completing the project within 24
months impossible.

(2) Any permittee holding an unexpired
permit may apply for an extension of the time
within which work is to be completed under that
permit when the permittee is unable to complete
work within the time required by this section for
good and satisfactory reasons. The building
official may extend the time for action by the
permittee for a period not exceeding 90 days on
written request by the permittee showing that
circumstances beyond the control of the permittee
have prevented work from being completed. No
permit shall be extended more than once.

(3) Where a permit has expired, the permit
can be reinstated and the work authorized by the
original permit can be recommenced, provided the
following are met:

(&) The Building Code under which the
original permit was issued and other laws
which are enforced by the code enforcement
agency have not been amended in any manner
which affects the work authorized by the
original permit.

(b) No changes have been made or will be
made in the original plans and specifications
for such work.

(c) The original permit expired less than
90 days from the request to reinstate.

(d) The fee for a reinstated permit shall be
one-half the amount required for a new
permit. Where the request for reinstatement
does not comply with the preceding criteria, a
new permit, at full permit fees, shall be

required.
(Ord. No. 1607, Repealed/Replaced, 07/21/2005; Ord. No.
1424, Enacted, 07/17/1997)



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

10.05.160 Permit Not Transferable.

A permit issued to one person or firm is not
transferable and shall not permit any other person

or firm to perform any work thereunder.
(Ord. No. 1607, Repealed/Replaced, 07/21/2005; Ord. No.
1424, Enacted, 07/17/1997)

10.05.170 Inspections.

It shall be the duty of the permit holder or
authorized agent to request all inspections that
may be necessary or otherwise required in a timely
manner, provide access to the site, and to provide
all equipment as may be deemed necessary or
appropriate by the building official. The permit
holder shall not proceed with construction activity
until authorized to do so by the building official.
It shall be the duty of the permit holder to cause
the work to remain accessible and exposed for
inspection purposes. Any expense incurred by the
permit holder to remove or replace any material
required for proper inspection shall be the

responsibility of the permit holder or his agent.
(Ord. No. 1607, Repealed/Replaced, 07/21/2005; Ord. No.
1602, Amended, 04/01/2005; Ord. No. 1424, Enacted,
07/171997)

10.05.180 Fees.

Fees charged under this code shall be adopted by

council resolution.
(Ord. No. 1607, Repealed/Replaced, 07/21/2005; Ord. No.
1424, Enacted, 07/17/1997)

10.05.190 Severability.

If any section, paragraph, subdivision, clause,
sentence, or provisions of this code shall be
adjudged by any court of competent jurisdiction to
be unconstitutional or invalid, such judgment shall
not affect, impair, invalidate, or nullify the
remainder of the code, but the effect thereof shall
be confined to the section, paragraph, subdivision,
clause, sentence or provision immediately
involved in the controversy in which such
judgment or decree shall be rendered, it being the
intent of the governing body to enact the
remainder of this code notwithstanding the parts
to be declared unconstitutional or invalid.

(10) 8

(Ord. No. 1607, Repealed/Replaced, 07/21/2005; Ord. No.
1424, Enacted, 07/17/1997)

10.05.200 Enforcement.

(1) Any person violating any of the provisions
herein, as the monetary penalty to be assessed,
shall have imposed upon them a civil penalty in an
amount not to exceed $5,000 per violation or, in
the case of a continuing violation, not more than
$1,000 for each day of the violation. Each day a
violation continues to exist shall constitute a
separate violation for which a separate civil
penalty may be assessed. The provisions of GRC
7.50.700 through GRC 7.50.750 shall apply to the
imposition of civil penalties under this section.

(2) In addition to any other penalty or
enforcement process provided by law, any person
determined to be responsible for violation of any
of the provisions herein may be required to correct
the violation.

(3) In addition to subsections (1) and (2) of
this section, violation of any of the provisions
herein shall also constitute a nuisance and may be
abated as provided in GRC Article 7.50.

(4) Additionally, the administrative
provisions adopted by GRC 10.05.110 apply to
any violation of the provisions herein.

(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1684,

Amended, 02/18/2010; Ord. No. 1607, Repealed/Replaced,
07/21/2005; Ord. No. 1424, Enacted, 07/17/1997)



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

Article 10.15
BUILDING PERMITS
Sections:

10.15.010 Payment Required.
10.15.020 Payment of Charqges.

10.15.010 Payments Required.

Applications for building permits within the city
shall not be approved until the applicant has paid
the required service charges for water service,
sewer service, public sidewalk, and driveway
approach.

10.15.020 Payment of Charges.

(1) Notwithstanding any other provision of
the Gresham Revised Code, the Gresham
Community Development Code or the Gresham
Building Code, a final inspection for residential,
commercial or industrial development or a
certificate of occupancy for commercial or
industrial development shall not be performed or
issued until all applicable system development and
facility charges have been paid or financed
pursuant to the Gresham Revised Code.

(2) The failure of the city to collect system
development, facility or any other charge at any
point when due or past due, shall not constitute a

waiver of the charge(s).
(Ord. No. 1540, Enacted, 03/07/2002)

(10) 9



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

Article 10.20
BURGLARY AND ROBBERY ALARM
SYSTEMS
Sections:
10.20.010 Purpose and Scope.
10.20.020 Definition.
10.20.030 Alarm Users Permit Required.
10.20.040 Fees for Excessive False Alarms.
10.20.050 No Response to Excessive Alarms.
10.20.060 Special Permits.
10.20.070 User Instructions.
10.20.080 Automatic Dialing Device; Certain
Interconnections Prohibited.
10.20.090 Hearing.
10.20.100 Sound Emission Cutoff Feature.
10.20.110 Confidentiality; Statistics.
10.20.120 Allocation of Revenues and
Expenses.
10.20.130 Interpretation.
10.20.140 Enforcement.
10.20.010 Purpose and Scope.

(1) The purpose of this article is to encourage
alarm users and alarm businesses to assume
increased responsibility for maintaining the
mechanical reliability and the proper use of alarm
systems to prevent unnecessary police emergency
responses to false alarms and thereby protect the
emergency response capability of the county from
misuse.

(2) This article governs burglary and robbery
alarm systems, requires permits, establishes fees,
provides for allocation of revenues and deficits,
provides for fees for excessive false alarms,
provides for no response to alarms, provides for
punishment of violations, and establishes a system
of administration.

(3) Revenue generated in excess of costs to
administer this article shall be allocated for the use
of participating law enforcement agencies to
recover costs associated with alarm responses and
for public education and training programs in
reduction of false alarms in accordance with GRC

10.20.120.
(Ord. No. 1587, Amended, 04/20/2004)

(10) 10

10.20.020 Definitions.

In addition to the definitions set forth in GRC
1.05.010, for purposes of this article, the following
mean:

Alarm Business. The business by any individual,
partnership, corporation, or other entity of selling,
leasing, maintaining, servicing, repairing, altering,
replacing, moving or installing any alarm system
or causing to be sold, leased, maintained, serviced,
repaired, altered, replaced, moved or installed any
alarm system in or on any building, structure or
facility.

Alarm System. Any assembly of equipment,
mechanical or electrical, arranged to signal the
occurrence of an illegal entry or other activity
requiring urgent attention and to which police are
expected to respond.

Alarm User. The person, firm, partnership,
association, corporation, company, or
organization of any kind that owns, controls, or
occupies any building, structure or facility in
which an alarm system is maintained.

Automatic Dialing Device. A device that is
interconnected to a telephone line and is
programmed to select a predetermined telephone
number and transmit by voice message or code
signal an emergency message indicating a need for
emergency response. Such a device is an alarm
system.

Bureau of Emergency Communications. The
city/county facility used to receive emergency and
general information from the public to be
dispatched to the respective police departments
using the bureau.

Burglary Alarm System. An alarm system
signaling an entry or attempted entry into the area
protected by the system.

Coordinator. The individual designated by the
sheriff to issue permits and enforce the burglar
alarm provisions of this article.



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

Economically Disadvantaged Person. A person
receiving public assistance or Supplemental
Nutrition Assistance Program (SNAP), or both.

False Alarm. An alarm signal, eliciting a response
by police when a situation requiring a response by
the police does not in fact exist, but does not
include an alarm signal caused by violent
conditions of nature or other extraordinary
circumstances not reasonably subject to control by
the alarm business operator or alarm user.

Interconnect.  To connect an alarm system
including an automatic dialing device to a
telephone line, either directly or through a
mechanical device that utilizes a telephone, for the
purpose of using the telephone line to transmit a
message upon the activation of the alarm system.

No Response. Peace officers shall not be
dispatched to investigate a report of an alarm
signal.

Police Chief. The Chief of Police of the city, or
designee.

Primary Trunk Line. A telephone line serving the
Bureau of Emergency Communications that is
designated to receive emergency calls.

Robbery Alarm System. An alarm system
signaling a robbery.

Sheriff. Sheriff of Multnomah County or
designated representative.

Sound Emission Cutoff Feature. A feature of an
alarm system that will cause an audible alarm to
stop emitting sound.

System Becomes Operative. The alarm system is

capable of eliciting a response by police.

(Ord. No. 1750, Amended, 05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1700,
Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1587, Amended,
04/20/2004)

10.20.030 Alarm Users Permits Required.

(1) Every alarm user shall obtain an alarm
user's permit for each system from the
coordinator's office within 30 days of the time

(10) 11

when the system becomes operative. Users of
systems using both robbery and burglary alarm
capabilities shall obtain separate permits for each
function. Application for a burglary or robbery
alarm user's permit and a fee for each shall be filed
with the coordinator's office each year. Each
permit shall bear the signature of the sheriff and
be valid for a one year period. The permit shall be
physically upon the premises using the alarm
system and shall be available for inspection by the
sheriff.

(2) Alarm Permit Fees and related fees shall
be set by council resolution.

(3) If a residential alarm user is a resident of
the premises in which the alarm is located and is
over the age of 62 or is an economically
disadvantaged person and is a resident of the
residence, and if no business is conducted in the
residence, a user's permit may be obtained from
the coordinator's office without the payment of a
fee.

(4) A late fee will be charged to an alarm user
who fails to obtain a permit within 30 days after
the system becomes operative, or to an alarm user
who is more than 30 days delinquent in renewing
a permit.

(5) If an alarm user fails to renew a permit
within 30 days after the permit expires, the
coordinator shall notify the alarm user, by certified
mail, that unless the permit is renewed and all fees
are paid within 30 days from the date of mailing
of the certified letter, police response to the alarm
will thereafter be suspended. If the permit is not
renewed and all fees are not paid the coordinator
shall suspend police response to the alarm and
make notifications as provided in GRC
10.20.050(2)(a)-(e).

(Ord. No. 1750, Amended, 05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1587,
Amended, 04/20/2004)

10.20.040 Fees For Excessive False Alarms.

(1) Fees for excessive false alarms will be
assessed by the coordinator for excessive false
alarms during a permit year. Fees for excessive
false alarms shall be set by council resolution.



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

(2) The coordinator shall notify the alarm
user and the alarm business by regular mail of a
false alarm, fees for excessive false alarms and the
consequences of the failure to pay the fees. The
coordinator shall also inform the alarm user of the
right to appeal the validity of the false alarm to the
sheriff, as provided in GRC 10.20.090. If the fee
has not been received in the coordinator's office
within 30 days from the day the notice of fee was
mailed by the coordinator and there is no appeal
pending on the validity of the false alarm, the
coordinator shall send the notice of fee(s) to be
paid by certified mail along with a notice of late
fee. If payment is not received within ten days of
the day the notice of late fee was mailed, the
coordinator shall initiate the no response process

and may initiate the enforcement of penalties.
(Ord. No. 1587, Amended, 04/20/2004)

10.20.050 No Response to Excessive Alarms.

(1) After the second false alarm, the
coordinator shall send a notification to the alarm
user by mail, which will contain the following:

(@) that the second false alarm has
occurred:;

(b) that if two more false alarms occur
within the permit year the police will not
respond to any subsequent alarms without the
approval of the sheriff or the police chief;

(c) that the approval of the sheriff or
police chief can only be obtained by applying
in writing for reinstatement. The sheriff or
police chief may reinstate the alarm user upon
a finding that reasonable effort has been made
to correct the false alarms;

(d) that the alarm user has the right to
contest the validity of a false alarm
determination through a False Alarm Validity
Hearing. The request for a hearing must be in
writing and within ten days of receipt of the
notice from the coordinator. (See GRC
10.20.090(1).

(2) After the fourth false alarm within the
permit year, there shall be no police response to

(10) 12

subsequent alarms without approval of the sheriff
or the police chief. The coordinator shall send a
notification of the police response suspension to:

(@) the Director of the Bureau of
Emergency Communications;

(b) the sheriff, if the alarm occurred in an
unincorporated area; or

(c) the police chief;
(d) the alarm user by certified mail; and

(e) the persons listed on the alarm user's
permit who are to be contacted in case of an
emergency, by certified mail.

(3) The suspension of police response to an
alarm shall begin ten days after the date of delivery
of the notice of suspension of service to the alarm
user unless a written request for a False Alarm
Validity Hearing has been made in the required
time period as listed in GRC 10.20.090.

10.20.060 Special Permits.

An alarm user required by federal, state, county or
municipal law, regulation, rule, or ordinance to
install, maintain and operate an alarm system shall
be subject to these alarm systems regulations,
provided:

(1) A permit shall be designated a special
alarm user's permit.

(2) A special alarm user's permit for a system
that has four false alarms in a permit year shall not
be subject to the no response procedure and shall

pay the regular fees.
(Ord. No. 1587, Amended, 04/20/2004; Ord. No. 1304,
Amended, 03/17/1994)

10.20.070 User Instructions.

(1) Every alarm business selling, leasing, or
furnishing to any user an alarm system installed on
premises located in the area subject to GRC
10.20.010 - 10.20.130, shall furnish the user with
instructions that provide information to enable



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

theuser to operate the alarm system properly and
to obtain service for the alarm system at any time.
The alarm business shall also inform each alarm
user of the requirement to obtain a permit and
where it can be obtained.

(2) Standard form instructions shall be
submitted by every alarm business to the sheriff.
If the sheriff finds the instructions are incomplete,
unclear, or inadequate, the sheriff may require the
alarm business to revise the instructions to comply
with GRC 10.20.070(1) and then to distribute the
revised instructions to its alarm users.

10.20.080 Automatic Dialing Device: Certain
Interconnections Prohibited.

(1) No person shall program an automatic
dialing device to select a primary trunk line and no
alarm user may fail to disconnect or reprogram an
automatic dialing device that is programmed to
select a primary trunk line within 12 hours of
receipt of written notice from the coordinator that
it is so programmed.

(2) No person shall program an automatic
dialing device to select any telephone line
assigned to the county and no alarm user may fail
to disconnect or reprogram such device within 12
hours of receipt of written notice from the
coordinator that an automatic dialing device is so

programmed.
(Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 03/03/2011)

10.20.090 Hearing.

(1) An alarm user may appeal the validity of
a false alarm determination by the coordinator to
the sheriff. The appeal shall be in writing and shall
be requested within 10 days of the alarm user
having received notice of the alarm from the
coordinator. Failure to contest the coordinator's
determination in the required time period results
in a conclusive presumption for all purposes that
the alarm was false.

(2) If a hearing is requested, written notice of
the time and place of the hearing shall be served
on the user by the sheriff by certified mail at least
10 days prior to the date set for the hearing, which

(10) 13

shall not be more than 21 nor less than 10 days
after the filing of the request for hearing.

(3) The hearing shall be before the sheriff.
The coordinator and the alarm user shall have the
right to present written and oral evidence, subject
to the right of cross-examination. If the sheriff
determines that the false alarms alleged have
occurred in a permit year, the sheriff may issue
written findings waiving, expunging or entering a
false alarm designation on an alarm user's record.
If false alarm designations are entered on the
alarm user's record, the coordinator shall pursue
fee collection of unpaid fees as set out in GRC
10.20.040(2).

(4) The sheriff may appoint another person to
be a hearings officer to hear the appeals and to

render judgment.
(Ord. No. 1587, Amended, 04/20/2004)

10.20.100 Sound Emission Cutoff Feature.

(1) Alarm systems that emit audible sound
that can be heard outside the building, structure or
facility of the alarm user, shall be equipped with a
sound emission cutoff feature which will stop the
emission of sound 15 minutes or less after the
alarm is activated.

(2) When an alarm system can be heard
outside a building, structure, or facility for more
than 15 minutes continuously or intermittently,
and the alarm user or alarm business is not
available or able to silence the device, the police
chief or sheriff may physically disconnect the
sounding device.

(3) The police chief or sheriff shall not be
liable for costs associated with reconnecting the
alarm system. The alarm owner shall be liable for

the cost of reconnecting the system.
(Ord. No. 1304, Amended, 03/17/1994)

10.20.110 Confidentiality; Statistics.

(1) All information submitted in compliance
with GRC 10.20.010 - 10.20.130 shall be held in
confidence and shall be deemed a public record
exempt from disclosure pursuant to ORS



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

192.502(4). Any violation of confidentiality shall
be deemed a violation of GRC 10.20.010 -
10.20.130. The coordinator has responsibility for
the maintenance of all records under GRC
10.20.010 - 10.20.130.

(2) Subject to the requirements of
confidentiality, the coordinator shall develop and
maintain statistics to assist alarm system
evaluation for use by members of the public.

10.20.120 Allocation of Revenues and
Expenses.

(1) The alarm permit fee collected under
GRC 10.20.030 shall be allocated to Multnomah
County for the administration of the alarm
ordinance and to the city for cost recovery of
police response and to offset costs for alarm
prevention education activities provided by the
city.

(2) All fees and forfeitures of security
deposits collected pursuant to GRC Avrticle 10.20,
and administered by Multnomah County officers
or employees, will be revenue of Multnomah
County; provided, however, that Multnomah
County shall maintain records sufficient to
identify the sources and amounts of that revenue.

(3) Multnomah County shall maintain
records in accordance with sound accounting
principles sufficient to determine on a fiscal year
basis the direct costs of administering GRC
Article 10.20 by Multnomah County officers or

employees, including salaries and wages
(excluding the sheriff individually), travel, office
supplies, postage, printing, facilities, office

equipment and other properly chargeable costs.

(4) Not later than July 31 of each year,
Multnomah County shall render an account to the
city for administering GRC Article 10.20. The
account shall establish the net excess revenue or
cost deficit for the preceding fiscal year and shall
allocate that excess revenue, if any, or deficit, if
any, to the county and the city proportionately as
the number of permits issued for alarm systems
within the corporate limits of the city bears to the
whole number of permits issued in Multnomah

(10) 14

County; provided, that no allocation shall be made
if the net excess revenue or deficit is less than
$2,500.00.

(5) Distribution by the county of any excess
revenue or payment of allocated deficit amounts
by the city shall be made not later than September
1 of each fiscal year.

(6) "Sound accounting principles” as used in
this section, shall include, but not be limited to,
practices required by the terms of any state or
federal grant or regulations applicable thereto

which relate to the purpose of GRC Article 10.20.
(Ord. No. 1587, Amended, 04/20/2004; Ord. No. 1507,

Amended, 10/19/2000; Ord. No. 1304, Amended,
03/17/1994)
10.20.130 Interpretation.

GRC 10.20.010 - 10.20.130 shall be liberally
construed to effect the purpose of these sections
and to achieve uniform interpretation and
application of these sections, the Multnomah
County Alarm Ordinance and ordinances of other
municipal corporations within Multnomah County
with the same purpose.

10.20.140 Enforcement.

(1) Enforcement of GRC 10.20.010 -
10.20.130 may be by civil action as provided in
ORS 30.315, or by criminal prosecution, as
provided in ORS 203.810 for offenses under
county law.

(2) The failure or omission to comply with
any part of GRC 10.20.010 - 10.20.130 shall be
deemed a violation and may be so prosecuted,

subject to the penalty provided in GRC 10.99.030.
(Ord. No. 1370, Amended, 08/15/1995)



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

Article 10.25
FIRE AND LIFE SAFETY CODE

Sections:

10.25.010 Adoption of Fire and L.ife Safety
Code.

10.25.020 Definitions.

10.25.030 Establishment and Duties of Life
Safety Division.

10.25.070 Amendments to the Fire Code.

10.25.080 Appeals.

10.25.090 Fire Safety Inspection Program.

10.25.100 Fines and Penalties.

10.25.010 Adoption of Fire and Life Safety
Code.

(1) The Oregon Fire Code as amended or
revised by the State of Oregon, including Oregon
adopted appendices, except as amended by GRC
10.25.070, is hereby adopted and enforced as part
of GRC Article 10.25, and shall be known as the
Fire and Life Safety Code of the City of Gresham
(hereafter known as "Fire Code™).

(2) Whenever a reference is made to any
portion of this code or any other applicable law or
ordinance, the reference applies to all amendments
and additions now or hereafter adopted by the

State of Oregon and the City of Gresham.

(Ord. No. 1750, Amended, 05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1700,
Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1689, Amended,
07/01/2010; Ord. No. 1641, Amended, 04/05/2007; Ord. No.
1594, Amended, 10/01/2004; Ord. No. 1585, Amended,
03/01/2004; Ord. No. 1560, Amended, 12/03/2002; Ord. No.
1504, Amended, 07/11/2000; Ord. No. 1409, Amended,
01/02/1997; Ord. No. 1267, Amended, 12/17/1992)

10.25.020 Definitions.

In addition to the definitions set forth in GRC
1.05.010, for purposes of this article, the following
mean:

Business. Any activity, trade, occupation,
profession, or pursuit conducted for the purpose of
generating revenue, whether for profit or non-
profit, regardless of occupancy type assigned by
code language.

(10) 15

Jurisdiction. Wherever the Fire Code uses the
term jurisdiction, the City of Gresham.

Fire Code Official. Wherever the Fire Code uses
the term Fire Code Official, the City of Gresham
Fire Chief or Fire Marshal.

Illegal Occupancy. Any business occupying a
building or on a premises without a city business
license, or the changing of an occupancy without
proper building and planning department permits
or certificate of occupancy.

Occupancy. The lawfully permitted purpose for
which a building or part thereof is used or intended

to be used.

(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1700,
Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1641, Amended,
04/05/2007; Ord. No. 1594, Amended, 10/01/2004; Ord. No.
1560, Amended, 12/03/2002; Ord. No. 1504, Amended,
07/11/2000; Ord. No. 1409, Amended, 01/02/1997)

10.25.030 Establishment and Duties of Life
Safety Division.

The Fire Code shall be enforced by the Life Safety
Division of the Gresham Fire and Emergency
Services, which shall be operated under the

direction of the fire chief.

(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1700,
Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1689, Amended,
07/01/2010; Ord. No. 1641, Amended, 04/05/2007; Ord. No.
1560, Amended, 12/03/2002; Ord. No. 1504, Amended,
07/11/2000; Ord. No. 1409, Amended, 01/02/1997; Ord. No.
1267, Amended, 12/17/1992)

10.25.070 Amendments to the Fire Code.

The Fire Code is amended and changed as follows:
1. Section 104.2 is amended to add:

104.2.1.The jurisdiction shall set by resolution
fees for special use permits.

2. Section 106.2 is amended to add:

106.2.3. The jurisdiction shall set by
resolution fees for the following:

a. Initial business fire inspections.
b. Reinspections.



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

c. Failure to abate hazards.

d. False alarms. Exceptions:
3. Section 308.1.4, Exceptions, is amended 1. Trees located in areas protected by an
to read: approved automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with Section
Exceptions: 903.1.1 or 903.1.2 shall not be
prohibited.

1. One and two family dwellings.
2. Within dwelling units of R-2
4. Section 308.1.4 is amended to add: occupancies.

308.1.4.1 Liquefied-petroleum-gas-fueled 7. Section 5701.4 is amended to read:
cooking devices. .

Permits.
LP-gas burners having an LP-gas
container with a water capacity greater
than 2.5 pounds (nominal 1 pound LP-gas
capacity) shall not be operated on
combustible balconies or within 10 feet of
combustible construction.

Permits for the installation of all
flammable or combustible liquid tanks
and/or storage of all flammable or
combustible liquids within or outside of
buildings are required within all areas of
the city.

Exception: . . 8. Section 5701.4 is amended to add:
One and two family dwellings.

. . 5701.4.1 Plans.
5. Section 505.1 is amended to read:
Construction  documents shall  be

Address Numbers. submitted with each permit application

New and existing buildings shall have for flammable or combustible liquid tanks
approved address numbers, building and/or the storage of same.

numbers  or  approved building ]

identification placed in a position that is Exception:

plainly legible and visible from the street ]

or road fronting the property. These 1. As required by 5701.6.

numbers shall contrast with their
background. Address numbers shall be
Arabic numerals or alphabet letters.

9. Section 6101.2 is amended to read:

Numbers shall be a minimum of 6 inches Permits.

high with a minimum stroke width of 0.5 Permits for the installation of all liquefied
inch and larger when required by petroleum gas (LPG) tanks and/or storage
Gresham Fire and Emergency Services of all LPG are required within all areas of
Standard Operating Guideline 3.1.5. the city. Distributors shall not fill a gas

container for which a permit is required
unless a permit for installation has been
issued for that location by the fire code
official.

6. Section 804.1.2 is amended to read:
Restricted occupancies.
Natural cut trees shall be prohibited in

Group A, E, I-1, 1-2, I-3, I-4, M, R-1, R-
2, R-4 and SR occupancies.

(10) 16



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

10. Section 6101.2 is amended to add:
6101.2.1 Plans.

Plans shall be submitted with each permit
application for liquefied petroleum gas

(LPG) tanks and/or storage of the same.

(Ord. No. 1750, Amended, 05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1700,
Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1689, Amended,
07/01/2010; Ord. No. 1641, Amended, 04/05/2007; Ord. No.
1594, Amended, 10/01/2004; Ord. No. 1560, Amended,
12/03/2002; Ord. No. 1521, Amended, 05/15/2001; Ord. No.
1504, Amended, 07/11/2000; Ord. No. 1481, Amended,
09/21/1999; Ord. No. 1409, Amended, 01/02/1997; Ord. No.
1330, Amended, 11/03/1994; Ord. No. 1282, Amended,
05/20/1993; Ord. No. 1267, Amended, 12/17/1992)

10.25.080 Appeals.

An appeal related to fire prevention statutes shall

be made as provided by ORS 479.180.
(Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1594,
Amended, 10/01/2004; Ord. No. 1409, Amended, 01/02/1997)

10.25.090 Fire Safety Inspection Program.

(1) Purpose and Scope. The purpose of this
section is to set forth the requirements of a Fire
Safety Inspection Program within the City of
Gresham for violations of the Fire Code. The
provisions of this section shall apply to each
business location of every business within the City
of Gresham.

(2) Hazard Level Designations. A hazard
level designation for each individual business will
be determined by the Fire Marshal based on
occupancy classification and existing hazards.
The Fire Marshal will utilize the hazard ratings
issued for occupancy designations by the National
Fire Protection Association (NFPA), 13,
“Installation of Sprinkler Systems,” and as
designated by OFC Chapter 2.  In cases of
multiple occupancy classifications, hazard level
placement will normally correspond to the
occupancy classification with the highest rated
hazard level.

(3) Fire Safety Inspections. Each business
location of every business located within the City
of Gresham is subject to a fire safety inspection by
Gresham FES each calendar year. An inspection

(10) 17

fee will be assessed when the inspection is
conducted. Inspection fees shall be established by
council resolution and correspond to the hazard
level designation for each business location as
determined by the Fire Marshal.

(4) Fire Safety Re-inspections. When
violations of the OFC are found in the course of an
annual inspection, Gresham FES shall conduct a
re-inspection, after allowing the appropriate time
for voluntary abatement of the violation. Fees for
reinspection shall be established by council
resolution.

(5) Failure to Abate OFC Violations. Failure
to abate OFC violations shall constitute a public
nuisance, and subject the violator to fines,
penalties, and nuisance abatement remedies
established in GRC Article 7.50, or as otherwise
authorized by law, including any enforcement
remedies, orders, or powers under the OFC.

(6) Business License Inspections. Any
person or business entity that applies for a license
to conduct business in a physical location within
the City of Gresham must obtain a Business
License Inspection by Gresham FES, and pay a fee
for that inspection, as established by council
resolution. Any person or business entity that
applies for a renewal of any license to conduct
business in a physical location within the City of
Gresham may be subject to a Business License
Inspection by Gresham FES, and pay a fee for that
inspection, as established by council resolution, if
a history of OFC code violations have been found
within said business location and a general fire
safety inspection has not been completed there
within the previous 12 months.

(7) Liens. Any fees, including fire safety
inspection and reinspection fees, and business
license inspection fees, shall, if not paid within 30
days of imposition, constitute a valid lien against
the property in favor of the City of Gresham, and
shall remain a lien against the property until fully
paid. The manager may record the lien in the
Multnomah County deed records. The city shall
collect an administrative fee as set by council
resolution for the release of any lien issued by the

city.



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1700,
Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1641, Amended,
04/05/2007; Ord. No. 1594, Amended, 10/01/2004; Ord. No.
1560, Amended, 12/03/2002; Ord. No. 1521, Enacted,
05/15/2001)

10.25.100 Fines and Penalties.

(1) Violations of the following sections of the
Fire Code may be subject to a fine or penalty in
the maximum amount of $5,000:

(a) Section 401.8, Interference with Fire
Department Operations;

(b) Section 109.3.2, Abatement of
Violation;

(c) Section 901.8, Removal of, or
Tampering with Fire Equipment;

(d) Section 401.5, False Alarms; or

(e) Section 2703.3, Unauthorized
Discharge of Hazardous Materials.

(2) Other sections. Except as otherwise
provided, violation of any other provision of the
Fire Code may be subject to a fine or penalty in
the amount of $1,000.

(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1700,
Enacted, 03/03/2011)

(10) 18



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

Article 10.26
FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS
Sections:

10.26.010 Purpose and Scope.

10.26.020 Definitions.

10.26.025 Violation.

10.26.030 Fines for Excessive False Alarms.
10.26.040 Hearing.

10.26.050 Enforcement.

10.26.010 Purpose and Scope.

(1) The purpose of this article is to encourage
fire alarm users and fire alarm businesses to
assume increased responsibility for maintaining
the mechanical reliability and the proper use of
alarm systems to prevent unnecessary fire
department emergency responses to false alarms
and thereby protect the emergency response
capability of the city from misuse.

(2) This article governs fire alarm systems,
provides for penalties and fines for excessive false
alarms, and establishes a system of administration.
Fire alarm system installation and maintenance are
governed by applicable provisions of GRC Atrticle

10.25. Fire and Life Safety Code.
(Ord. No. 1381, Amended, 07/01/1995; Ord. No. 1330,
Enacted, 11/03/1994)

10.26.020 Definitions.

In addition to the definitions set forth in GRC
1.05.010, for purposes of this article, the following
mean:

Alarm Business. The business by any individual,
partnership, corporation, or other entity of selling,
leasing, maintaining, servicing, repairing, altering,
replacing, moving or installing any alarm system
or causing to be sold, leased, maintained, serviced,
repaired, altered, replaced, moved or installed any
fire alarm system in or on any building, structure
or facility.

Alarm User. The person, firm, partnership,
association, corporation, company, or

(10) 19

organization of any kind that owns, controls, or
occupies any building, structure or facility in
which a fire alarm system is maintained.

Coordinator. The individual designated by the
Fire Chief to enforce the provisions of this article.

False Alarm. An alarm signal, eliciting a response
by the fire department when a situation requiring
a response by the fire department does not in fact
exist, but does not include an alarm signal caused
by violent conditions of nature or other
extraordinary circumstances not reasonably
subject to control by the alarm business operator
or alarm user.

Fire Alarm System. Any assembly of equipment,
mechanical or electrical, arranged to signal the
presence of products of combustion or the flow of
an extinguishing agent through an automatic fire
extinguishing system or a device manually
activated by a person to signal the presence of fire
requiring urgent attention and to which the fire
department is expected to respond.

Fire Chief. The Chief of the Fire Department of

the city, or designee.
(Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1330,
Enacted, 11/03/1994)

10.26.025 Violation.

(1) No alarm user shall cause or permit a false
alarm.

(2) Three or more false alarms occurring
within one year prior to the date of the false alarm
occurrence may be subject to a fine or penalty in

the maximum amount of $1,000.

(Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1507,
Amended, 10/19/2000; Ord. No. 1381, Amended,
02/01/1996)

10.26.030 Fines For Excessive False Alarms.

(1) After the second false alarm, fines will be
assessed by the coordinator for excessive false
alarms occurring within one year prior to the date
of the false alarm occurrence. The amount of the
fine for excessive false alarms shall be set by
council resolution.



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

(2) The coordinator shall notify the alarm
user and the alarm business by regular mail of a
false alarm and the fine and the consequences of
the failure to pay the fine. The coordinator shall
also inform the alarm user of the right to appeal
the validity of the false alarm to the fire chief, as
provided in GRC 10.26.040. If the fine has not
been received in the coordinator's office within 30
days from the day the notice of fine was mailed by
the coordinator and there is no appeal pending on
the validity of the false alarm, the coordinator
shall send the notice of fine by certified mail along
with a notice of late fee. The amount of the late

fee shall be set by council resolution.
(Ord. No. 1750, Amended, 05/07/2015; Ord. No. 1330,
Enacted, 11/03/1994)

10.26.040 Hearing.

(1) An alarm user may appeal the validity of
a false alarm determination by the coordinator to
the fire chief. The appeal shall be in writing and
shall be requested within 10 days of the alarm user
having received notice of the false alarm and fine
from the coordinator. Failure to contest the
coordinator's determination in the required time
period results in a conclusive presumption for all
purposes that the alarm was false. The fire chief
shall review the record and affirm, modify or
reverse the coordinator’s decision.

(2) The fire chief’s decision may be protested
to a hearings officer pursuant to GRC 7.50.030.

(3) The fire chief and hearings officer shall
determine if three or more false alarms have
occurred in the year prior to the date of the false
alarm in question and shall issue written findings
waiving, expunging or entering a false alarm
designation on an alarm user's record. If false
alarm designations are entered on the alarm user's
record, the coordinator shall pursue fine collection

as set by council resolution.
(Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1590,
Amended, 09/16/2004; Ord. No. 1330, Enacted, 11/03/1994)

10.26.050 Enforcement.

Enforcement of this GRC Article 10.26 may be by
civil action as provided in ORS 30.315 for the
fines set forth in GRC 10.26.030; or the

(10) 20

coordinator may issue a citation to the violator. A
person convicted of a violation of this article shall
be fined in accordance with the penalty provisions
of GRC Article 10.99.

(Ord. No. 1561, Amended, 01/02/2003; Ord. No. 1381,
Enacted, 02/01/1996)



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

Article 10.27

PERMIT-REQUIRED CONFINED
SPACE RESCUE

Sections:

10.27.010 Permit-Required Confined Space
Rescue.

10.27.020 Subscriber Fee.

10.27.030 Non-subscriber Fee.

10.27.010 Permit-Required Confined Space
Rescue

The Gresham Fire Department may develop a
program to provide rescue services within its
response area for permit-required confined spaces

as set forth in OAR Chapter 437.
(Ord. No. 1377, Enacted, 11/16/1995)

10.27.020 Subscriber Fee.

Employers having permit-required confined
spaces within the fire department's response area
may subscribe to the confined space rescue service
by paying a subscriber fee, as established by
council resolution. The subscriber fee shall be
based on the number of permit-required confined

spaces.
(Ord. No. 1377, Enacted, 11/16/1995)

10.27.030 Non-subscriber Fee.

If permit-required confined space rescue services
are provided by the city to an employer that has
not subscribed to this service, the city shall charge
the employer a non-subscriber fee as established

by council resolution.
(Ord. No. 1377, Enacted, 11/16/1995)

(10) 21



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

Article 10.30
PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE
Sections:

10.30.010 Short Title.

10.30.020 Purpose.

10.30.025 Definitions.

10.30.030 Scope and Application.

10.30.033 Exterior Conditions and Derelict
Structures.

10.30.035 Adoption of International Property
Maintenance Code.

10.30.060 Responsibility.

10.30.070 Modifications.

10.30.140 Emergency Repair.

10.30.170 Weather Proofing and Screens.

DERELICT STRUCTURES

10.30.200 Derelict Structures Prohibited.

10.30.205 Inspection of Property in Default.

10.30.210 Closing and Securing Derelict
Structures.

10.30.220 Derelict Structure Registration.

ENFORCEMENT

10.30.230 Complaint Process.

10.30.270 Temporary Waivers of
Enforcement Action.

10.30.280 Hardship Waivers of Enforcement
Action.

10.30.290 Enforcement.

10.30.310 Receivership Authority.

10.30.320 Lien.

10.30.340 Application of Other Codes.

10.30.360 Coordination of Enforcement.

10.30.400 Decommissioning and Removal of
Renewable Energy Systems.

10.30.010 Short Title.

This article shall be known and may be cited as the
Property Maintenance Code of Gresham,

hereinafter referred to as the “PMC.”
(Ord. No. 1649, Amended, 12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1535,
Enacted, 11/01/2001)

10.30.020 Purpose.

The council finds and declares that conditions that
promote blight and deterioration or that create a
hazard to the public health and safety, are
injurious to the health, safety and general welfare
of the public, and that the provisions of the PMC
are necessary to protect the public health, safety

and general welfare.
(Ord. No. 1649, Amended, 12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1602,
Amended, 04/01/2005; Ord. No. 1535, Enacted, 11/01/2001)

10.30.025 Definitions.

In addition to the definitions set forth in GRC
1.05.010 and, in addition to the definitions set
forth in the ICCPMC, the following definitions
shall apply to the PMC:

Where terms are not defined in the PMC or other
code section and are defined in the state building,
plumbing or mechanical codes, such terms shall
have the meanings ascribed to them as in those
state codes. Where terms are not defined through
the methods authorized by this section, such terms
shall have ordinarily accepted meanings such as
the context implies.  Whenever the words
“premises,” “building” or other similar words are
stated in the PMC, they shall be construed as
though they were followed by the words “or any
part thereof.” Unless otherwise expressly stated,
the following terms shall, for the purposes of the
PMC, have the following meanings:

Attractive nuisance. A condition that can attract
children and be detrimental to the health or safety
of children whether in a building, on the premises
of a building or upon an unoccupied lot. This
includes, but is not limited to: abandoned
buildings, abandoned wells, shafts, basements,
excavations, abandoned freezers or refrigerators
with  self-latching doors, motor vehicles,
structurally unsound fences or structures, lumber,
trash, fences, debris, or water feature that may
prove hazardous for inquisitive minors.

Boarded building. An unoccupied or derelict
building that has been secured against entry by
material such as plywood, boards or other similar
material placed over openings that are designed
for and/or are required for windows and doors,




GRESHAM REVISED CODE

and which is visible off the premises and is not
both lawful and customary to install on an
occupied structure.

Building. Any structure occupied or intended for
any occupancy.

Building code. GRC Article 10.05.

Derelict Structure. Any structure that is:

(1) unoccupied and unsecured,

(2) partially constructed and does not have a
valid structural building permit;

(3) partially constructed; with a valid
structural building permit, and within any 180-day
period has not received full approval for the next
applicable structural inspection in the following
order:

(a) footing and foundation;

(b) framing, including lateral force
resisting system; and

(c) roofing, including specified roof
drainage, and the exterior surfaces of the
structure are not protected from the elements
in a manner to render the structure weather
resistant and prevent decay.

(4) maintained in a condition that is unfit for
human habitation as provided by ICCPMC
Section 108;

(5) maintained in an unsafe condition as
defined by ICCPMC Section 304 and that is an
imminent threat to public health and safety; or

(6) while vacant, the structure has been
subject to a city-initiated abatement pursuant to
GRC Atrticle 7.50.

Deterioration. A lowering in quality of the
condition or appearance of a building, structure
or parts thereof characterized by holes, breaks,
rot, crumbling, cracking, peeling, rusting, or any
other evidence of physical decay, neglect,
excessive use, or lack of maintenance.

(10) 23

Lender. Any person that makes, extends or holds
a loan secured by real property and includes, but
not limited to, mortgages, beneficiaries under
trust deeds, vendors under conditional land sales
contracts, trustees and a successor in interest to
any mortgage, beneficiary, vendor, or trustee.

Manager. The city manager or the manager’s
designee.

Notice of Default. A written notice to a borrower
stating that a default on a mortgage, deed of trust,
or other loan agreement, is in default, and that
legal action may be taken to cure the default or
foreclosure on the security interest.

Renewable Energy System. Systems which
produce energy from sources that do not use up
finite natural resources. Examples include, but
are not limited to, solar, wind, biomass,
geothermal, and micro-hydro systems.

Unoccupied. Vacant or not being used for a lawful
occupancy.

Unsecured. A structure where entry by
unauthorized persons is not rendered impossible
and includes, but is not limited to, a structure
without:

(1) any portion of its exterior wall greater
than one square foot in area;

(2) any portion of its roof greater than one
square foot in area;

(3) one or more exterior doors;

(4) one or more exterior doors which cannot
be manually locked:;

(5) one or more exterior windows; or

(6) one or more exterior windows which

cannot be manually locked.

(Ord. No. 1787, Amended, 11/01/2018; Ord. No. 1770,
Amended, 03/23/2017; Ord. No. 1756, Amended,
08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1726, Amended, 07/18/2013; Ord. No.
1709, Amended, 12/01/2011; Ord. No. 1700, Amended,
03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1649, Amended, 12/18/2007; Ord. No.
1535, Enacted, 11/01/2001)



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

10.30.030 Scope and Application.
The purpose of this article is to:

(1) Establishes the property maintenance
requirements applicable to all residential rental
property as defined in GRC Avrticle 9.55.

(2) Establish property maintenance
requirements applicable to derelict structures as
defined in GRC 10.30.025.

(3) Establish property maintenance
requirements applicable to exterior conditions of

all properties in the city.

(Ord. No. 1669, Amended, 04/16/2009; Ord. No. 1649,
Amended, 12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1535, Amended,
11/01/2001)

10.30.033 Exterior Conditions and Derelict
Structures.

(1) The following provisions relating to
exterior conditions and derelict structures apply to
all property in the city:

(a) Administrative provisions of the
PMC are as follows: GRC 10.30.020; GRC
10.30.025; GRC 10.30.060; GRC 10.30.070;
GRC 10.30.170; GRC 10.30.230; GRC
10.30.270; GRC 10.30.280; GRC 10.30.290;
GRC 10.30.310; GRC 10.30.320; GRC
10.30.340; and GRC 10.30.360.

(b) Emergency repair provision of GRC
10.30.140.

(c) Weatherproofing and Screens
provision of GRC 10.30.170.

(d) Derelict Structures Provisions of
GRC 10.30.200; GRC 10.30.210; and GRC
10.30.220.

(e) Section 108 Unsafe Structures and
Equipment, Section 109  Emergency
Measures, and Section 110 Demolition, of the
International Property Maintenance Code,
2012 Edition, prepared by the International
Code Council, as hereinafter amended or
revised (“ICCPMC”).

(f) Rodent harborage provision of
ICCPMC, Section 302.5.

(9) Swimming pools provision of
ICCPMC, Section 303.1.

(h) Exterior surfaces provision of
ICCPMC, Section 304.

(i) Street numbers  provision  of
ICCPMC, Section 304.3, as amended by GRC
10.30.035(4).

(J) Foundation walls provision of the
ICCPMC, Section 304.5.

(k) Exterior walls provision of the
ICCPMC, Section 304.6.

() Roofs and drainage provision of the
ICCPMC, Section 304.7.

(m) Decorative features provision of the
ICCPMC, Section 304.8.

(n) Windows and doors provision of the
ICCPMC, Section 304.13.

(o) Glazing provision of the ICCPMC,
Section 304.13.1.

(p) Accessory structures provision of the
ICCPMC, Section 302.7.

(q) Sidewalks and driveways provision of
the ICCPMC, Section 302.3.

(Ord. No. 1783, Amended, 05/01/2018; Ord. No. 1770,
Amended, 03/23/2017; Ord. No. 1756, Amended,
08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No.
1669, Renumbered and Amended, 04/16/2009; Ord. No.
1649, Amended, 12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1535, Amended,
11/01/2001)

10.30.035 Adoption of International Property
Maintenance Code.

(1) The International Property Maintenance
Code, 2012 Edition, prepared by the International
Code Council, as thereinafter amended or revised
(“ICCPMC”), except as repealed or amended
below, is hereby adopted as part of the PMC.



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

(2) When the phrase “the code official shall”
is used in the ICCPMC with respect to
enforcement, it refers to the manager’s
discretionary option, rather than a mandatory
obligation, to choose the course of action that
would be appropriate when a violation of the code
is found. The phrase “code official shall” does not
impose on the city a mandatory duty to implement
particular enforcement procedures.

(3) The following sections of the ICCPMC
are repealed:

(@) Section 102.6 of the ICCPMC.

(b) Sections 103.1,103.2 and 103.3 of the
ICCPMC.

(c) Section 106 of the ICCPMC.

(d) Section 108.2 of the ICCPMC. The
Derelict  Structures provisions of GRC
10.30.200, GRC 10.30.210, GRC 10.30.220,
and GRC 10.30.230 are adopted in its place.

(e) Section 111 of the ICCPMC.
(f) Section 304.14 of the ICCPMC.
(g) Section 404.5 of the ICCPMC.

(4) The following sections of the ICCPMC
are amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These Regulations shall be
known as the Property Maintenance
Code of Gresham, hereinafter referred to
the “PMC.”

102.3 Application of Other Codes.
Repairs, additions or alterations to a
structure, or changes of occupancy and
all other work required under the PMC
shall be done in accordance with the
procedures and provisions of the codes
and provisions adopted in GRC Articles
10.05, 10.15, 10.20, 10.25, 10.26 and
10.60.

103.4 Liability. The provisions and
protections of the Oregon Tort Claims

(10) 25

Act, ORS 30.265 et. seq. shall apply to
all city officials, agents and employees
charged with the enforcement of the
PMC. The PMC shall not be construed
to relieve from or lessen the
responsibility of any non-city agent or
employee, including but not limited to
any owner, owner’s agent, builder,
contractor, agent or employee of any
builder or contractor, or any person
owning, operating or controlling any
building, structure or premises, for any
damages to persons or property caused
by defects or violations of this code, nor
shall the code enforcement agency or the
city be held as assuming any such
liability by reason of the inspections
authorized by this code or any permits or
certificates issued under this code.

103.5 Fees. Fees charged under the
PMC shall be adopted by council
resolution.

201.3 Terms Defined in Other
Codes. Where terms are not defined in
the PMC and are defined in the codes and
provisions adopted in GRC Articles
10.05, 10.15, 10.20, 10.25, 10.26 and
10.60, such terms shall have the
meanings ascribed to them as stated in
those codes.

302.4 Weeds. All  premises and
exterior property shall be maintained free
from invasive or noxious weeds in
accordance with GRC 7.15.020, GRC
7.15.040 and GRC Article 10.25 and any
action taken thereunder.

302.8 Motor Vehicles. Except as
provided in other provisions of the GRC,
no vehicle shall be kept on residential
premises in a state of major disassembly,
disrepair, or in the process of being
stripped or dismantled, except and unless
it is covered by a manufactured vehicle
cover designed specifically for that
purpose, enclosed within a permitted
structure, or behind a fence.



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

302.9 Defacement of Property. The
owner or occupant of property, or person
in charge of property, shall comply with
the requirements of GRC Atrticle 7.80.

304.3 Street Numbers. Each structure
to which a street number has been
assigned shall have such number
displayed in a position easily observed
and readable from the public right-of-
way as required by the Fire Code. This
section shall apply if, due to deterioration
or loss, the numbers must be otherwise
repaired, placed or replaced.

304.13.1 Glazing. All  glazing
materials shall be maintained free from
cracks and holes. Glazing with holes,
cracks, or that is partially or wholly
missing shall be replaced within thirty
(30) calendar days of the incident that
caused the defect.

304.13.3 Window  Sill  Height.
Windows in sleeping rooms that are
provided to meet emergency escape or
rescue requirements shall have a sill
height of no more than 44 inches above
the floor or above an approved,
permanently installed step. The step must
not exceed 12 inches in height and must
extend the full width of the window. The
top surface of the step must be a
minimum of six feet from the ceiling
above the step.

Exception:  Window  sill  heights
constructed in accordance with code
requirements in place for sleeping rooms
at the time of construction.

304.13.4  Minimum Dimensions.
Windows in sleeping rooms that are
provided to meet emergency escape or
rescue requirements shall have a
minimum net clear opening at least 20
inches wide, at least 22 inches high, and,
if constructed after July 1, 1974, at least
five square feet in area.

(10) 26

Exception: Window dimensions
constructed in accordance with code
requirements in place for sleeping room
at the time of construction.

304.13.5 Ability to Open. Every
window required for ventilation or
emergency escape shall be capable of
being easily opened and held open by
window hardware. Any installed storm
windows on windows required for
emergency escape must be easily
openable from the inside without the use
of a key or special knowledge or effort.

305.3.1 Interior Dampness. Every
residential  rental unit, including
basements, and crawl spaces, shall be
maintained  reasonably free  from
dampness to prevent  conditions
conducive to decay, mold growth, or
deterioration of the structure.

401.3 Alternative devices. In lieu of
the means for natural light and
ventilation prescribed in Sections 402
and 403 of this code, artificial light or
mechanical ventilation complying with
GRC Article 10.05 shall be permitted.

403.4 Process ventilation. Where
injurious, toxic, irritating or noxious
fumes, gases, dusts or mists are generated,
a local exhaust ventilation system shall be
provided to remove the contaminating
agent at the source. Air shall be exhausted
to the exterior and not be recirculated to
any space.

Exception: Range hoods constructed in
accordance with code requirements in
place at the time of construction.

505.1 General. Every sink, lavatory,
bathtub or shower, drinking fountain,
water closet or other plumbing fixture
shall be properly connected to either a
public water system or to an approved
private water system. All kitchen sinks,
lavatories, laundry facilities, bathtubs
and showers shall be supplied with hot or



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

tempered and cold running water in
accordance with the provisions of GRC
10.05.070.

505.4 Water heating facilities. Water
heating facilities shall be properly
installed, maintained and capable of
providing an adequate amount of water to
be drawn at every required sink, lavatory,
bathtub, shower and laundry facility at a
temperature of not less than 120°F (49°C).
A gas-burning water heater shall not be
located in any bathroom, toilet room,
bedroom or other occupied room
normally kept closed, unless adequate
combustion air is provided. An approved
combination temperature and pressure-
relief valve and relief valve discharge pipe
shall be properly installed and maintained
on water heaters.

602.2 Residential Occupancies.
Dwellings shall be provided with heating
facilities capable of maintaining a year-
round room temperature of 68°F (20°C)
in all habitable rooms. Cooking
appliances shall not be used to provide
space heating to meet the requirements of
this section. Portable heating devices
may not be used to meet the dwelling
heat requirements of this code. No
inverted or open flame fuel-burning
heater shall be permitted. All heating
devices or appliances shall be of an
approved type.

602.3 Heat Supply. Every owner and
operator of any building who rents,
leases or lets one or more dwelling units
or sleeping units on terms, either
expressed or implied, to furnish heat to
the occupants thereof shall supply heat to
maintain a year-round temperature of not
less than 68°F (20°C) in all habitable
rooms.

602.4 Occupiable Work Spaces.
Indoor occupiable work spaces shall be
supplied with heat to maintain a year-
round temperature of not less than 68°F

(10) 27

(20°C) during the period the spaces are
occupied.

603.1 Mechanical appliances. All
mechanical appliances, fireplaces, solid
fuel-burning appliances, cooking
appliances and water heating appliances
shall be properly installed and maintained
in a safe working condition, and shall be
capable of performing the intended
function. Mechanical ventilation systems
for range hoods and bathrooms shall be
maintained in sound working order
meeting manufacturer specifications for
operation and function.

604.2 Service. The size and usage of
appliances and equipment shall serve as
a basis for determining the need for
additional facilities in accordance with
GRC 10.05.080. Dwelling units shall be
served by a three-wire, 120/240 volt,
single-phase electrical service having a
rating of not less than 60 amperes.

702.1 General. A safe, continuous and
unobstructed path of travel shall be
provided from any point in a building or
structure to the public way. Means of
egress shall comply with GRC Article
10.25.

702.2 Aisles. The required width of
aisles in accordance with GRC Article
10.25 shall be unobstructed.

702.3 Locked Doors. All means of
egress doors shall be readily openable
from the side from which egress is to be
made without the need for keys, special
knowledge or effort, except where the
door hardware conforms to that
permitted by GRC Article 10.05.

704.1 General. All systems, devices and
equipment to detect a fire, actuate an
alarm, or suppress or control a fire or any
combination thereof shall be maintained
in an operable condition at all times in
accordance with GRC Atrticle 10.25.



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

704.2 Smoke Alarms.  Single or
multiple-station smoke alarms shall be
installed and maintained in Groups R-2,
R-3, R-4 and in dwellings not regulated
in Group R occupancies, regardless of
occupant load at all of the following
locations:

1. On the ceiling or wall outside
of each separate sleeping area in the
immediate vicinity of bedrooms.

2. In each room used for
sleeping purposes.

3.  In each story within a
dwelling unit, including basements
and cellars but not including crawl
spaces and uninhabitable attics. In
dwellings or a dwelling unit with

split levels and without an
intervening door between the
adjacent levels, a smoke alarm

installed on the upper level shall
suffice for the adjacent lower level
provided that the lower level is less
than one full story below the upper
level.

Single or multiple—station smoke alarms
shall be installed in other groups in
accordance with GRC Article 10.25.

705.1 Carbon Monoxide Detectors.
Carbon monoxide alarms shall be
installed, maintained and repaired in
residential units in accordance with ORS
Chapter 90.

(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1669,
Amended, 04/16/2009; Ord. No. 1649, Enacted, 12/18/2007)

10.30.060 Responsibility.

(1) Unless otherwise provided for, the
manager shall be responsible for the ultimate
enforcement of all of the provisions of the PMC.
The manager may appoint such enforcement
officers, technical assistants, inspectors and other
employees as may be necessary for the
administration of the PMC. For the purpose of the
PMC, any person so appointed will be deemed a

(10) 28

“code official” as defined in the ICCPMC. The
manager is authorized to designate an employee
who shall exercise all the powers of the manager
during the temporary absence or disability of the
manager.

(2) Where work is required to be done to
correct violations under the PMC any and all
permits required for such work by the Building
Code shall be obtained. All final inspections shall
be approved for the associated permits prior to the

violations being considered resolved.
(Ord. No. 1669, Amended, 04/16/2009; Ord. No. 1649,
Amended, 12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1535, Enacted, 11/01/2001)

10.30.070 Modifications.

In the event of extreme hardships involved in
carrying out provisions of the PMC relating to
external conditions and derelict structures, the
manager shall have the right to vary or modify the
provisions of the PMC upon application of an
owner, provided that the spirit and intent of the
law is observed and that the public health and

safety is assured.
(Ord. No. 1649, Amended, 12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1602,
Amended 04/01/2005; Ord. No. 1535, Enacted, 11/01/2001)

10.30.140 Emergency Repair.

The use of tarps or similar material for the purpose
of an emergency repair, or temporarily in place of
a customary building component such as a roof,
siding or a door, shall not exceed 90 days in any
consecutive 12 month period; provided, however,
that this subsection is subject to, and does not
supersede, the requirements of the Building Code
and Fire Code. The use of tarps or similar material
in place of a customary building component is not

permitted under the Building Code.
(Ord. No. 1649, Amended, 12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1535,
Enacted, 11/01/2001)

10.30.170 Weather Proofing and Screens.

Where windows and doors have been sealed by
plastic or other materials for weather proofing,
said materials shall be maintained in a
workmanlike manner. Window and door screens,
while not required by the PMC, shall be
maintained in a sound working condition.



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

(Ord. No. 1649, Amended, 12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1535,
Enacted, 11/01/2001)

DERELICT STRUCTURES

10.30.200 Derelict Structures Prohibited.

(1) No person shall own or operate a property
that contains a derelict structure.

(2) A derelict structure, once identified, shall
be inspected and maintained by the property
owner or lender in accordance with this code until
it is lawfully occupied, to ensure it does not
become a general nuisance, chronic nuisance, or

does not violate the Property Maintenance Code.
(Ord. No. 1770, Amended, 03/23/2017; Ord. No. 1709,
Amended, 12/01/2011; Ord. No. 1649, Amended,
12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1535, Enacted, 11/01/2001)

10.30.205 Inspection of Property in Default.

(1) Within 30 days of issuing a Notice of
Default to a borrower for property located in the
City of Gresham, the lender shall perform an
inspection to determine if the property is or
appears to be a derelict structure as defined in
GRC 10.30.025.

(2) Ifthe property is or appears to be a derelict
structure, the lender shall register the property and
comply with GRC 10.20.220.

(3) Unless the borrower remedies the Notice
of Default and the property is not or does not
appear to be a derelict structure, the lender shall
inspect the property monthly during the period of
the Notice of Default, any foreclosure process, or
while the lender has title to the property. If during
these monthly inspections, the property becomes
or appears to become a derelict structure, the
lender shall register the property as a derelict

structure per GRC 10.30.220.
(Ord. No. 1783, Amended, 05/01/2018; Ord. No. 1770,
Enacted, 03/23/2017)

10.30.210 Closing and Securing of Derelict
Structures.

(1) The manager may order appropriate
measures to render a derelict structure secure from

(10) 29

entry. The securing of the structure shall be by
methods calculated to render entry very difficult,
including, but not limited to, the use of lag bolts in
the boarding of entry points, instead of nailing.

(2) In order to perform the function or duty
authorized or required under this section, city
representatives and their agents shall have the
right at reasonable times to enter upon the property
and render a derelict structure secure from entry.
If consent to inspect or secure the property is
refused, abatement and/or inspection warrants
under GRC 7.50.222 and GRC 7.50.520 shall be
utilized.

(3) The costs incurred by the city in boarding
or securing a derelict structure may be assessed to
the property owner and collected as costs of
abatement under GRC 7.50.240 and GRC
7.50.260.

(4) The manager may order the perimeter of
the lot upon which a derelict structure is located to
be secure from unauthorized entry if there are
reports that the property is subject to trespass,
vandalism, or other nuisance or chronic nuisance
activities. Examples of securing the perimeter of
a lot includes installing a temporary six-foot fence
with structurally sound top and bottom rails,
posted no trespassing noticed and warnings,
secured to prevent unauthorized entry, and
maintained in good condition. The requirements
of the perimeter fence are at the discretion of the
manager.

(Ord. No. 1770, Amended, 03/23/2017; Ord. No. 1669,

Amended, 04/16/2009; Ord. No. 1649, Amended,
12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1535, Enacted, 11/01/2001)

10.30.220 Derelict Structure Registration.

(1) The manager shall maintain a list of
derelict structures.

(2) The owner or lender of a derelict structure
shall register the structure with the manager within
10 calendar days of the manager’s written
direction to register, or the determination by the
lender that the property is or appears to be a
derelict structure. Registration shall be completed
on forms provided by the manager, and shall
include:



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

() the location of the property;

(b) the ownership of the property,
including address, phone number, and email
address;

(c) the name of the lender, balance of the
mortgage or deed of trust on the property, and
lender’s contact number, including phone,
address, and email address;

(d) the expected period of its vacancy;

(e) a schedule for inspection and
maintenance of the property during the period
of vacancy, with a minimum of monthly
inspections and maintenance to ensure
compliance with the city code;

(f) the agent responsible for inspection
and maintenance, including address, phone
number, and email address;

(9) a plan and schedule for repairs that
will allow re-occupancy and use of the
structure, or for its demolition to remove the
structure from derelict status; and

(h) a provision whereby the owner of the
structure shall indemnify, defend and hold the
city harmless from any and all claims asserted
against the city by third parties stemming from
injuries to persons or to property as a result of
the condition or accessibility of the structure.

(3) The plan required by subsection (2)(g) of
this section shall include the following:

(@) how the property will comply with the
general nuisance requirements of GRC Avrticle
7.15;

(b) how the property will be kept free of
all weeds, dry brush, trash, junk and other
items that give the appearance that the
property is abandoned;

(c) how the property will be kept free of
all graffiti, tagging and other markings. Any
removal or painting over of graffiti shall be

(10) 30

with an exterior grade paint that matches the
color of the exterior of the structure;

(d) if pools and spas will not be
completely drained, how pools and spas will
be kept in working order so that water remains
clear and free of pollutants and debris. Pools
and spas must comply with the minimum
security fencing requirements of Property
Maintenance Code;

(e) how the property will be secured in a
manner so it is not accessible to unauthorized
persons.

(4) Fee. An initial registration application
and a registration renewal must be accompanied
by a non-refundable fee in the amount established
by council resolution.

(5) The registration and plan are subject to
review and approval by the manager. Failure by
the owner, person in charge of property, or lender
to implement the terms of the approved derelict
structure registration and plan is a violation of this
code.

(6) A derelict structure, once identified and
registered, shall be inspected and maintained by
the property owner, lender or designated local
agent on a schedule and in a manner to ensure the
property is in compliance with GRC Article 10.30,
the Gresham Revised Code and the approved
derelict structure registration and plan, until the
structure is no longer a derelict structure.

(7) The lender or local designated agent shall
post a direct contact name and 24-hour contact
phone number for persons to report problems or
concerns, and the posting shall be placed on the
interior of a window facing the street to the front
of the property so it is visible and legible from the
street. If no such area exists, the posting shall be
placed on the exterior of the property in a location
visible and legible from the street to the front of
the property. An exterior posting shall be printed
with on and with weather resistant materials.

(8) Any change in the information provided
pursuant to this subsection shall be given to the
manager within 30 calendar days of the change.



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

When the owner or lender believes the structure is
no longer derelict the owner shall contact the
manager and request an inspection to determine

that the structure is no longer derelict.

(Ord. No. 1783, Amended, 05/01/2018; Ord. No. 1770,
Amended, 03/23/2017; Ord. No. 1709, Amended,
12/01/2011; Ord. No. 1669, Amended, 04/16/2009; Ord. No.
1649, Amended, 12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1535, Enacted,
11/01/2001)

ENFORCEMENT
10.30.230 Complaint Process.

(1) Complaints of a derelict structure or for
violations of the PMC are to be directed to the
manager. The manager shall take the necessary
steps to determine the existence of any violations,
including any not listed in the original complaint;
take steps to require property owners to remedy
conditions and defects found to violate the PMC;
initiate suspension or revocation of a residential
rental property license or other remedies under
GRC Article 9.55 if applicable; initiate
enforcement procedures under GRC Article 7.50;
or take other such action as may be appropriate to
ensure compliance with the PMC.

(2) When the complaint relates to a derelict
structure or exterior property conditions only, the
manager may direct a copy of the complaint to the
relevant neighborhood association or the
Neighborhood Coalition. The  affected
neighborhood association or the Neighborhood
Coalition may provide information and evidence
to the manager concerning the complaint. Neither
the  neighborhood  association nor the
Neighborhood Coalition has any authority to
enforce any aspect of the PMC.

(3) The manager may initiate an inspection of
residential rental property, a specific residential
rental unit, if necessary, or a derelict structure, to
determine the validity of the complaint. Any such
inspection may be in addition to residential rental
property inspections contemplated under GRC
Avrticle 9.55.

(4) If the property owner, designated agent, or
tenant refuses to allow an inspection of the
premises or residential rental unit that is the
subject of the complaint, the city may obtain an

(10) 31

administrative inspection warrant as provided for
in GRC 7.50.510 and GRC 7.50.520.

(5) For residential rental units, following each
inspection, the inspector will complete an
inspection checklist for each residential rental unit
inspected and provide a copy of the completed
form to the owner or designated agent and the
residential rental unit tenant. The occupier will
receive a copy of the notice of inspection
checkilist.

(6) If the manager determines that the
complaint is verified, or the residential rental unit
subject to the complaint failed to meet the
standards set forth in the PMC, GRC Article
10.30, the manager will initiate enforcement as
provided in GRC Article 7.50 or GRC 10.30.210
as applicable.

(7) In the event any life threatening health
and/or safety condition or defect is found to exist,
the condition or defect may be summarily abated
as provided in GRC Avrticle 7.50.

(@) In addition to summary abatement,
the residential rental license may be denied,
suspended or revoked, and the tenant(s)
relocated with the assistance of the city and/or
emergency housing service providers.

(b) Residential rental units found to be
directly affected by life threatening health
and/or safety condition(s) or defect(s) shall
not be occupied unless and until the
designated condition and/or defect has been
satisfactorily corrected as determined by
subsequent inspection.

(c) All costs of abatement, including all
tenant relocation costs incurred by the city in
this section, shall be the responsibility of the
residential rental property owner and assessed
as provided for in GRC Article 7.50.

(8) An existing license may be suspended, or
a renewal license not issued, unless and until all
conditions and/or defects concerning the licensed
residential rental property subject to the complaint
have been corrected.



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

(9) Complaints under this section shall be
considered confidential by the city and shall not be
subject to public disclosure under the Oregon
Public Records Act, unless disclosure is required

by law.
(Ord. No. 1669, Amended, 04/16/2009; Ord. No. 1649,
Amended, 12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1535, Enacted, 11/01/2001)

10.30.270 Temporary Waivers of
Enforcement Action.

(1) The manager may issue a temporary
waiver of enforcement action, which will give a
period of time that the manager determines is
reasonable, but no longer than six months, to
correct the violations found. The length of time
given will depend on several factors, such as the
extent and cost of the repairs, seriousness of the
conditions, financial capacity of the owner, and
the time of year. During the waiver period, the
affected residential rental unit(s) may not be
occupied.

(2) The manager may revoke the waiver if
any of the conditions that allowed the owner to
qualify for a waiver change. Because the waiver is
granted to a specific property owner, the waiver
automatically terminates upon change in
ownership. The manager may, assist the owner in
obtaining information regarding financial or other

assistance to make the necessary repairs.
(Ord. No. 1649, Amended, 12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1535,
Enacted, 11/01/2001)

10.30.280 Hardship Waivers of Enforcement
Action.

(1) The manager may issue a hardship waiver
of enforcement action only if the owner currently
legally resides on the property. A hardship waiver
may be issued only in those instances when the
owner is found by the manager to be over 65 years
of age, disabled, or classified as “very low
income” under the US Department of Housing and
Urban Development (HUD) standards. Hardship
waivers shall not exceed three years. The income
level of the owner will be reevaluated before the
end of the three year waiver period. Application
for a hardship waiver must be filed with the
manager in writing. The manager may require the
owner to supply all information necessary to

(10) 32

demonstrate the owner’s eligibility for the waiver.
The owner must submit a separate application for
waiver for each notice of complaint and violation.

(2) The manager may revoke the waiver if
any of the conditions that allowed the owner to
qualify for a waiver change. Because the waiver is
granted to a specific property owner, the waiver
automatically terminates upon change in
ownership or tenure of the property.

(3) The owner may reapply for new hardship
waivers to become effective at the expiration of
the term of any hardship waiver previously
granted.

(4) The manager may assist the owner in
obtaining information concerning financial or

other assistance to make the necessary repairs.
(Ord. No. 1535, Enacted, 11/01/2001)

10.30.290 Enforcement.

(1) Violation of any section of the PMC may
be subject to a fine or penalty in the maximum
amount of $1,000. A violation applies to each
property or residential rental unit in violation of
the PMC. Each day a violation occurs or
continues is a separate violation.

(2) The remedies available under GRC
9.55.160 shall also be available to address

violations of the PMC.
(Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1669,
Amended, 04/16/2009; Ord. No. 1649, Amended,
12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1647, Amended, 09/20/2007; Ord. No.
1535, Enacted, 11/01/2001)

10.30.310 Receivership Authority.

In addition to, and not in lieu of any other
provisions of the PMC, when residential property
is found to violate the PMC, the violation is a
threat to the public health and safety, and the legal
owner has not acted in a timely manner to correct
the violation(s), the manager may apply to a court
of competent jurisdiction for the appointment of a
receiver to perform an abatement pursuant to the
Oregon Housing Receivership Act (ORS 105.420
to 105.455).



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

(Ord. No. 1649, Amended, 12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1602,
Amended, 04/01/2005; Ord. No. 1535, Enacted, 11/01/2001)

10.30.320 Lien.

Abatement costs, late payment charges,
reinspection fees, or other fees or charges imposed
under the PMC, shall constitute a valid lien against
the property in favor of the city of Gresham if not
paid within 30 calendar days of imposition of the
fees. The lien shall remain valid against the
property until fully paid. The manager may record
the lien in the Multnomah County deed records.
The city may collect an administrative fee for the
release of any lien issued by the city that shall be

set and adjusted by council resolution.

(Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1649,
Amended, 12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1602, Amended,
04/01/2005; Ord. No. 1535, Enacted, 11/01/2001)

10.30.340 Application of Other Codes.

Nothing in the PMC shall be construed to relieve
a person from complying with any federal, state or
local law, including any other provisions of the
GRC, or the requirement to obtain all necessary

permits and approvals.
(Ord. No. 1649, Amended, 12/18/2007; Ord. No. 1535,
Enacted, 11/01/2001)

10.30.360 Coordination of Enforcement.

The manager shall make reasonable effort to
arrange for the coordination of enforcement
efforts and any necessary inspections in an effort
to minimize conflicts between the activities of

affected city departments.
(Ord. No. 1535, Enacted, 11/01/2001)

10.30.400 Decommissioning and Removal of
Renewable Energy Systems.

(1) Renewable energy systems that have
reached the end of their useful life or have been
abandoned shall be decommissioned and
removed.

(2) A renewable energy system that is no
longer in use or that has reached the end of its
useful live shall be considered abandoned.

(10) 33

(3) Absent notice from an owner that a
renewable energy system has been abandoned, a
renewable energy system shall be considered
abandoned when it does not operate for more than
one year.

(4) If the owner of a renewable energy system
demonstrates extenuating circumstances for the
reasons a renewable energy system has not been in
operation, the owner of a renewable energy system
may submit a written request to the manager
requesting an extension to the time period before
it will be determined to be abandoned. The
manager shall grant such reasonable requests.

(5) The owner of a renewable energy system
shall decommission and remove a renewable
energy system within 90 days of the date that it is
abandoned.

(6) Decommissioning and removal shall
consist of:

(d) deactivating a renewable energy
system from use;

(b) physical removal of all equipment,
wiring,  mounting,  security  barriers,
foundations and transmission lines;

(c) disposal of any solid and hazardous
waste in accordance with local, state, and
federal waste disposal regulations; and

(d) stabilization or re-vegetation of the
site as necessary to minimize erosion.

(7) Upon written request to the manager, the
owner may be permitted to leave landscaping or
designated below-grade foundations to minimize

erosion and disruption to the vegetation.
(Ord. No. 1726, Enacted, 07/18/2013)



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

Article 10.50

PROPERTY TAX EXEMPTION FOR
NEW, TRANSIT SUPPORTIVE,
MULTIPLE-UNIT HOUSING OR
MIXED USE DEVELOPMENT

Sections:

10.50.155 Continuation of Prior Exemption.

10.50.155 Continuation of Prior Exemptions.

Any project granted an exemption under GRC
Avrticle 10.50 prior to July 16, 1998 shall not be
affected by the amendments to GRC Article 10.50
made on or after that date, and any project granted
an exemption after July 16, 1998 and prior to
January 1, 2006 shall not be affected by the
amendments to or repeal of GRC 10.50.015
through GRC 10.50.145, and shall be subject to
provisions in effect at the time the exemption was
granted, and for this purpose those provisions of
GRC Article 10.50 (Ordinance No. 1370 as
amended by Ordinance Nos. 1445 and 1466) shall
continue to be in effect and shall continue to apply
to the project and exemption as if the amendments
made to GRC Article 10.50 on July 16, 1998, and
the repeal of GRC Article 10.50, GRC 10.50.015
through GRC 10.50.145 were not in effect.
Projects granted an exemption shall continue to
receive the exemption according to the same
schedule and subject to the same disqualification
provisions that were in effect and applied at the

time the project was granted an exemption.
(Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1445,
Enacted, 07/16/1998)

(10) 34



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

Article 10.60

MARINAS AND FLOATING
STRUCTURES

Sections:

10.60.010 Statement of Purpose and Intent.

10.60.020 Scope.

10.60.030 Definitions.

10.60.040 Administration and Enforcement.

10.60.050 Regulations for Floating
Structures.

10.60.060 Requlations Pertaining to Floating
Homes, Combos, Boat Houses
and Related Accessory
Structures.

10.60.070 Construction Other than Floating
Homes.

10.60.080 Engineered Construction.

10.60.090 Electrical Installations.

10.60.100 Plumbing Installations.

10.60.110 Mechanical Installations.

10.60.010 Statement of Purpose and Intent.

It is the purpose of this ordinance to promote the
public's health, safety and welfare through the
regulation of floating structures and their
appurtenances. These regulations recognize that
waterborne structures, by their very nature
confront different environmental factors than do
structures located on land. Furthermore, it is
recognized that waterborne structures have
distinctive design requirements such that strict
adherence or application of the land oriented
Specialty Codes is not always appropriate and that
modifications or exceptions should be made in
appropriate circumstances in the application of

those codes.
(Ord. No. 1636, Enacted, 01/18/2007)

10.60.020 Scope.

The provisions of this ordinance apply to the
construction, addition, prefabrication, alternation,
repair, use, and occupancy of floating structures.
This ordinance does not apply to the construction,
maintenance, or operation of vessels or boats,
except a boat shall not discharge waste into the

(10) 35

waters of the city except as allowed by federal
(Coast Guard approved sanitation devices) or state
regulations.

Floating structures moved into or constructed in
the City of Gresham shall comply with the latest
edition of the Oregon Specialty Codes and this
ordinance as for new construction. Floating
Homes, combos and their accessory structures
shall be built to the Oregon Residential Specialty
Code and all others shall be classified by the
Building Official per their building use in the

Oregon Specialty Codes.
(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1636,
Enacted, 01/18/2007)

10.60.030 Definitions.

In addition to the definitions set forth in GRC
1.05.010, for the purpose of GRC Article 10.60,
the following mean:

Addition. An increase in the floor area or height
of a structure or building.

Alteration. Any change or modification of
existing construction.

Berth. An open (uncovered) waterside area
defined by floating walkways and finger-floats,
for the wet storage of a boat.

Boathouse. A covered floating structure used
primarily for the wet or dry storage of a boat.

Combo. A
combination.

boathouse-floating home

Dangerous Structure. Any structure that has the
potential to threaten the safety of person or

property.

Fire Apparatus Access Roads. Roads providing
the driving surface for fire department vehicles
responding to an emergency, extending from a
public right-of-way to a point nearest a moorage
Or marine gangway or pier.

Floating Home or Houseboat. A floating structure
used primarily as a dwelling unit, including boat
houses, combo structures, and accessory
structures.




GRESHAM REVISED CODE

Floating Structure. A structure supported by a
flotation system and held in place by piling and
mooring devices, including but not limited to
boathouses, floating homes, marinas, and
walkways.

Gangway. A variable slope structure intended to
provide pedestrian access between a fixed pier or
shore and a floating structure.

Marina. Floating structure(s) used primarily for
the service, and/or repair, sale or moorage of boats
in berths, but may include other occupancies.

Moorage. A site used for the mooring of one or
more floating structures or boats and includes the
piling, mooring connectors, piers, ramps,
gangways, walkways, and the land area used in
conjunction therewith.

Moorage: Pre-existing Non-conforming. Built or
annexed before 1985.

Moored or Mooring. The attachment of a boat or
floating structure in one location temporarily or
permanently to piles, walkways, gangways, piers
or other structures.

Mooring Connectors. A connection between a
floating structure, floating home, boathouse,
berth, or marina, and a pile, pier, walkway, ramp,
gangway or other structure, with the capability to
hold the structure in place under reasonably
expected conditions.

Mooring Site. A site within a moorage designed
or used for the mooring of a boat, boathouse,
floating home or other occupied floating structure.

New Construction. A new building or structure or
an addition to an existing building or structure.

Pier. A non-floating fixed platform extending out
over the water from shore to which gangways are
usually attached.

Ramp. A fixed sloped structure providing
pedestrian access between portions of a moorage,
which are at different elevations.

(10) 36

Repair. The reconstruction or renewal of any part
of an existing structure for the purpose of its
maintenance.

State of Oregon Specialty Codes. A code of
regulations adopted and enforced under GRC
Chapter 10 commonly referred to as the Structural
Specialty Code, Mechanical Specialty Code,
Plumbing Specialty Code, Electrical Specialty
Code, Residential Specialty Code, Fire Code,
Energy Efficiency Specialty Code, Manufactured
Dwelling and Park Specialty Code, and the Solar
Installation Specialty Code.

Tender House. A non-habitable,

floating
accessory building.

Transient Tie-Up. A floating structure used
exclusively for the open moorage of pleasure
boats on a short term, maximum 72-hour stay.

Walk. A fixed portion of a floating home structure
providing access to and around a floating home.

Walkway. A covered or open floating structure
used for ingress or egress to a mooring site. There
are three types:

(1) Einger-float. A fingerlike floating
structure, usually attached perpendicular to a main
walkway, which physically defines a berth and
provides direct pedestrian access to and from a
berthed boat or floating home.

(2) Main Walkway. A floating structure to
which several finger-floats are attached, thereby
providing direct pedestrian access between the
berths and marginal walkways or shore.

(3) Marginal Walkway. A floating structure,
which provides pedestrian access between two or
more main walkways and/or shore.

Waste. Means garbage, litter, or sewage including
kitchen, bath and laundry waste except for effluent

from Coast Guard approved sanitation devices.
(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1700,
Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1636, Enacted, 01/18/2007)



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

10.60.040 Administration and Enforcement.

(1) Responsibility.

(@ The Building Division  shall
administer and enforce the provisions of this
ordinance except that the Fire Marshal shall
have the responsibility for the inspection of
existing moorages as well as the testing and
inspection of standpipes. In the event that the
Fire Marshal determines a violation of this
ordinance has occurred at a moorage under his
jurisdiction, he shall report the same to the
Building Division which will then have the
enforcement authority thereof.

(b) The State of Oregon Marine Board
shall have responsibility for enforcing
pleasure boat rules and regulations pertaining
to operation and carriage requirements; and
issuance of a certificate of Title, identifying
number plate, and disposition of all
abandoned floating homes, combos and
boathouses; and rules and regulations
regarding floatation encapsulation. The State
of Oregon Department of Environmental
Quality shall have responsibility for enforcing
violations pertaining to the dumping of waste
into the waters of the city.

(c) Nothing in this ordinance is intended
to displace or conflict with any other relevant
federal, state statute, rule or regulation nor
grant exemption there from.

(2) Permits and Inspections.

(@) It shall be unlawful for any person,
firm or corporation to erect, construct,
enlarge, alter, repair, move, improve, remove,
or convert any structure regulated by this
ordinance, except as provided for herein, or
cause the same to be done without first
obtaining a separate permit for each structure
from the building official as required by this
ordinance.

(b) Exemption  from  the  permit
requirements of this ordinance shall not be
deemed to grant authorization for any work to

(10) 37

be done in any manner in violation of the
provisions of this ordinance or any other rules
or regulations of the City of Gresham, the
State of Oregon, or the Federal government.
Failure to comply with the terms of this
ordinance, subjects a person to such remedies
as the building official, in the exercise of their
reasonable discretion, deems appropriate and
as may be otherwise limited by law. Unless
otherwise exempted, separate, building,
plumbing, electrical and mechanical permits
are required for any work performed covered
by this ordinance.

(c) Permits and inspections shall be
required for the following:

() For all work, including fire
protection systems, a permit shall be
obtained before beginning construction,
additions, alteration or repairs (other than
ordinary repairs), using application forms
furnished by the building official.
Ordinary repairs are nonstructural repairs
and do not include addition to, alteration
of, or replacement or relocation of water
supply, sewer, drainage, drain leader, gas,
waste, vent or similar piping, electrical
wiring, or mechanical or other work for
which a permit is required by the building
official.

(i) Permanent connections to
docks for plumbing, electrical, structural
and mechanical work, where existing or
new floating homes or combos are moved
into or moved within the City of Gresham.

1) Arrangements with regard to
permits and inspection for projects
constructed outside of Gresham but
intended for use in Gresham are to be
made with the Building Official prior
to the commencement of construction
or installation.

(iii) ~ The new construction of
public and private floating structures such
as, but not limited to, moorage, marinas,
yacht clubs, places of assembly, living
guarters, marine service stations and



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

repair facilities; and attendant piling,
mooring  connectors, piers, ramps,
gangways, walkways, land structures,
roadways and parking areas.

(iv) Any new and/or alteration to any
electrical, plumbing, heating/air
conditioning installation on a floating
structure, including wood stoves.

(d) Inspection requests.

(i) The permit holder or permit
holder’s agent shall be responsible to
request inspection and obtain approval
prior to proceeding with the next phase of
work.

(ii) Owners of gated marinas are
required to provide full access to their
marinas for the purpose of inspections and
investigations. Where needed the city will
be provided a key card or access code for
official use only.

(3) Eees. Fees shall be paid in advance for all
permits and inspections as required by other
ordinances of the City of Gresham.

(4) Right of Appeal. A person aggrieved by
a requirement, decision, or determination arising
out of this article may appeal pursuant to GRC
10.05.130.

(5) Alternate materials, methods, and
systems. The provisions of this code are not
intended to limit the appropriate use of materials,
appliances, equipment or methods of design or
construction not specifically prescribed by this
ordinance, provided the Building Official
determines that the proposed alternate materials,
appliances, equipment or methods of design or
construction are at least equivalent of that
prescribed in this ordinance in suitability, quality,
strength, effectiveness, fire resistance, durability,
dimensional stability, safety and sanitation.

(6) Modifications. =~ Whenever there are
practical difficulties involved in carrying out the
provisions of this code, or when the strict
application of the Specialty Codes does not allow

(10) 38

the use of traditional nautical design, the Building
Official may grant modifications for individual
cases, providing that findings are first made that a
special individual reason makes the strict letter of
the codes impractical, that the modification is in
conformity with the purpose and intent of the
codes and that such modification does not lessen
any fire protection requirements or any degree of

structural integrity.
(Ord. No. 1636, Enacted, 01/18/2007)

10.60.050 Regulations for Floating
Structures.

(1) General.

(@) Floating structures and moorages
shall comply with these specific regulations as
well as applicable Specialty Codes, including
NFPA 303, and all other applicable
regulations of the city, state, and federal
governments. Where conflicts exist between
these specific regulations and other
regulations, this ordinance shall apply. All
installations lawfully in existence at the time
of the adoption of this ordinance may
continue, provided such continued use is not
dangerous to life or adjoining property and is
maintained in good working order.

(b) Existing floating structures moved to
the City of Gresham shall comply with this
ordinance as though they were new
construction or they must be approved by the
Building Official.

(2) Maintenance. All floating structures and
supporting  structural  systems, electrical,
plumbing and mechanical installations and
devices required by this ordinance shall be

maintained in good serviceable condition.
(Ord. No. 1636, Enacted, 01/18/2007)

10.60.060 Regulations Pertaining to Floating
Homes, Combos, Boat Houses
and Related Accessory
Structures.

(1) Floating Homes, Boat Houses and Combo
Structures.




GRESHAM REVISED CODE

(a) Regulations pertaining to alterations
and additions to floating homes. Alterations
of up to 50 percent, by size, and additions of
up to 25 percent, by size, may be made with
like materials in a like manner without regard
to new construction clearance above water
and separation requirements.

(b) Retroactive Identification Required
of Existing Floating Homes. Within 60 days
of the adoption of this ordinance, all floating
homes shall be identified by number or letter
minimum 4 inches in height and visible from
the dock.

(2) Separation Required Between Existing

Floating Structures.

(a) Separation required between existing
floating homes:

(i) The separation existing at the
time of the adoption of this ordinance
between one floating home and another is
approved.

(i) Floating homes relocated
within a moorage or moved from one
moorage to another shall be spaced a
minimum of six feet apart between the
nearest exterior walls and four feet apart
at the nearest roof projections, or be
provided with the alternative protection

system as  required in GRC
10.60.060(2)(b).
(iii) Main floor additions to

existing floating homes, up to 25 percent
by size, may be built with the same
separation that existed at the time of the
adoption of this ordinance.

(iv) New, main floor additions to
existing floating homes, in excess of 25
percent by size, and second floor
additions of any size, shall be spaced a
minimum of 6 feet apart between the
nearest exterior walls and 4 feet apart at
the nearest roof projections, or be
provided with the alternative protection

(10) 39

system as required in GRC

10.60.060(2)(b).

(b) Alternate protection systems to
minimum  separation between adjacent

floating homes.  When the wall-to-wall
separation is less than six feet, or the roof-to-
roof separation is less than four feet, the
structure being moved or added to shall be
equipped throughout with a complete
automatic sprinkler system installed in
compliance with NFPA 13D or alternate
methods approved by the building official.

New

(3) Separation Required Between

Floating Structures.

(a) Distance between floating homes.

(i) Floating homes at new moorages
shall be spaced a minimum of 10 feet apart
between the nearest exterior walls and
eight feet apart between the nearest roof
projections.

(ii) Separation distances may be
reduced to six feet apart between the
nearest exterior walls and four feet apart
between the nearest roof projections when
one of the following is provided:

1) A complete sprinkler system
is installed in compliance with NFPA
13D.

2) One hour rated exterior walls
with protected openings.

(b) Occupancy separation. A covered
boat well, in a floating home, enclosed on
more than two sides shall be separated from
the habitable space per the Oregon Residential
Specialty Code requirements for Garages and
Carports with water resistant gypsum board
on the boat well side.

(4) Materials and installations.

(&) Structural materials within 18 inches
of the water.



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

(i) Structural members and connectors
shall be fabricated of materials or be coated or
treated such that the materials will resist
deterioration due to their proximity to the
water, except logs used for flotation, steel
piling and steel stringers.

(if) Framing lumber shall be pressure
treated with an approved preservative;
framing connectors shall be hot-dipped
galvanized or noncorrosive metal except
for pins; plywood shall have exterior type
adhesive; exposed plywood shall be
exterior grade.

(b) Thermal insulation.  Main floor
insulation shall be of a type approved for
damp locations.

(c) Under-floor ventilation. All enclosed
floating home, combo, or boathouse wood
construction systems, shall be ventilated in
accordance with the building code.

(5) Conventional Construction Methods and

Materials for Floating Homes.

(@) Floating homes.  The following
methods and materials are approved without
engineering provided the highest point of the
roof structure measured from the top of the
first floor joists does not exceed 75 percent of
the minimum width of the log float.

(i) The logs and stringers forming
the floats under floating homes and living
portions of combos shall conform to these
provisions:

1) The structure on the float
cannot be larger than the float, except
for decks.

2) Raft logs are to be 16 inch
minimum diameter at the tip and shall
be spaced no greater than I8 inches
between tangent points.

3) Bearing walls should align
over stringers or centerline of logs.

(10) 40

When not feasible, adequate support
for bearing walls shall be provided.

4) If the building inspector finds
the completed log raft insufficiently
stable for the intended structure he or
she may then require the stringer
layout to compose a rigid frame by the
addition of side chords and fixed
joints or cross bracing.

5) Logs shall be Douglas Fir,
Sugar Pine, Lodge Pole Pine, Western
(Idaho) White Pine, Alaska Yellow
Cedar and Sitka Spruce, sound and
free of all bark above the water line.

6) Inafloating home foundation
float at least 50 percent of all logs
shall be full length. Segmented logs
must be alternated between full-
length logs. All outboard logs shall be
full length of the float.

7) Logs shall be notched so as to
provide sufficient bearing for the
stringers. The seat of the notch shall
be a minimum of 4-1/2 inches above
the water level.

8) Timber stringers shall be
nominally a minimum of 4 inches by
10 inches for one story construction
and 6 inches by 10 inches for two story
or higher construction and shall be
pressure treated to a retention of 0.4
pounds per cubic foot or refusal. Steel
stringers shall be wide flange shapes
with a minimum depth of 10 inches
and minimum thickness of .25 inches.

9) Stringers inside of bearing
walls shall be placed on the logs not
more than four feet on center and
fixed to the logs with headed steel
rods a minimum of 5/8 inches in
diameter and a minimum of 20 inches
long. These pins are to penetrate the
log at least 10 inches. Outside log
connections and log ends are to have
two pins.



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

10) The wood construction
below the joists is to be inspected for
proper construction and soundness of
logs, including dapped bearing
connections, prior to installation of
joists.

(b) Floatation. Floating homes need only
have adequate flotation to maintain a
clearance above the water that will result in
the lowest floor being dry under all applicable
load conditions.

(c) Connections:

(i) Floating homes shall be anchored
with connections to the logs. There shall
be a minimum of two attachment points to
the logs and these points shall be a
minimum of one foot from each end.

(if) The connections shall consist of a
steel bracket or other approved
connection. The bracket is to be 3/8 inch
thick and adequate in size to support the
pins. Pins are to be a minimum of 4 inches
apart. This bracket shall be fixed with a
minimum of three, headed steel rods a
minimum of 5/8 inch in diameter and
penetrate the log at least 10 inches.

(iii) The connections from the bracket
to the walkway or piling shall consist of
chain with a minimum link wire diameter
of 1/2 inch. If attached to walkway logs,
the boom chain shall be looped around the
second log or most secure log of the
walkway.

(d) Walkways.

(i) Floating walkway supports may
consist of pressure treated six inch x six
inch stringers not more than six feet-0
inches on center or four inch x six inch
stringers not more than five feet-zero
inches on center anchored to the logs with
headed steel rods as described above.
Single headed steel rods may be used at
interior logs. Maximum joist spacing is
two feet-zero inches on center.

(10) 41

(if) Walkways shall be adequately
secured to pilings.

(iii) A two-foot wide walk providing a
clear and unobstructed egress shall be
provided on all sides of all floating homes
where emergency egress is required on the
main floor, with a continuous path to the
main dock.

(e) Mooring connections.

(i) The intent of the provisions of
subsection (c), above, is to provide
construction that shall be adequate to keep
the structure in place under all reasonable
load conditions. In some instances it may
be necessary for the builder to provide
additional measures.

(ii) Bumpers or impact absorbing
cushions must be attached to the
foundation  float near anchorage
connection points, minimum two per
floating home float.

(Ord. No. 1700, Amended, 03/03/2011; Ord. No. 1636,
Enacted, 01/18/2007)

10.60.070 Construction Other than Floating

Homes.

(1) Moorages.

(a) Identification. All moorages shall be

provided with identification as follows:

(i) All moorages shall be identifiable
by name and address from the street on
which they front at or near the point of
emergency vehicle access. The design
must be in high contrast with their
background and the symbols must not be
less than 6 inch in height with a stroke of
not less than % inch.

(i) The head of the gangway
providing access to the moorage shall be
obviously identifiable from the point of
emergency Vvehicle access; or in those
cases having a secondary access road,
from the shore end of the access road; or



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

the facility shall be signed as required to
provide such identification.

(iii) When door to gangway is locked,
install an approved lock box and provide
key or card key for Fire Department
access.

(iv) The location and identification of
all floating structures shall be obvious
from the head of the gangway or a sign
shall be provided indicating the layout of
the moorage and the walkway and
structure identification method.

(v) The walkway and structure
identification shall be logical and obvious.

(2) Existing Moorages.

(a) Fire protection standpipe shall be

installed per NFPA 14.

(i) The following described fire
protection standpipe system shall be
required at all moorages within one year
of the effective date of this ordinance; or
an agreement shall be established within
six months of the effective date of this
ordinance for such an installation to be
completed within 3 years from the date of
the agreement, unless an alternative
arrangement  has been  previously
approved by the Fire Marshal.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Installations requiring the use
of pumps may have an additional
year for the installation of the
pump or pumps.

2. Installations for moorages
serving only pleasure boats may
have an additional three years for
the installation of the complete
system (six years total) from the
date of adoption of this ordinance.

3. Installations for moorages
used exclusively for loading and

(10) 42

off loading boats or vessels and
transient tie-up moorages.

(if) Moorages having any portion of a
floating structure more than 250 feet from
the point of fire apparatus set up, shall
have a dry standpipe system designed and
installed in accordance with the Fire
Code, NFPA 14 and the following:

1) Have a water supply that
complies with any one of the
following:

a. Municipal water
providing 1000 GPM through an
approved fire hydrant located
within 50 feet of the closest point
of fire department access to a
moorage site exit ramp with a Fire
Department Connection (FDC)
within 50 feet of this fire hydrant.

b. Rivers or associated
bodies of water with pump or
pumps capable of providing 250
GPM at 100 psi to any single
outlet on the standpipe system.
Pumps are to be powered with
natural gas or propane and be
listed by Underwriters
Laboratory.

2) Have standpipe sized to
provide 250 gallons per minute at 100
psi pressure to any single outlet with
a maximum input pressure of 150 psi.

3) Have adequate drain valves
installed to ensure complete drainage.

4) Have gate valve outlets made
of noncorroding metal, 2-1/2 inch I.D.
with  National Standard threads
spaced a distance apart as follows:

a. For moorages having
marine service stations, floating
homes or other type of structures
having permanent living quarters,
valves are to be every 100 feet and



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

within 50 feet of the end of
walkways.

b. For moorages serving
only boathouses, valves are to be
every 150 feet and within 75 feet
of the end of the walkways.

c. For moorages having
only open moorage of pleasure
boats, standpipes shall only be
required along the marginal
walkway with valves required
only at intersecting main
walkways, or not less than every
200 feet and 100 feet from the end
of marginal walkways not having
intersecting main walkways.

5) All fire protection standpipe
systems shall be installed under
benefit of permit from the Gresham
Building Department.

6) Standpipe systems shall be
tested in accordance with the Fire
Code and NFPA 14. The Fire Marshal
shall be notified at least 24 hours in
advance of all tests and tests shall be
done in their presence or the presence
of their representative. An annual
service test will be conducted by a
qualified service agency to assure the
continuity of the system.

7) Fire extinguishers rated not
less then 3A:40BC shall be secured in
place beginning at the start of the
walkway system and repeated at
intervals not to exceed 150 feet on all
walkways and finger floats.

(b) Regulations pertaining to repairs to
moorages.

(i) Repairs requiring the replacement
of 50 percent or more of the piling shall
be made in accordance with the provisions
for new construction.

(10) 43

(i) Repairs requiring the
replacement of less than 50 percent of the
piling may be made with like materials in
a like manner.

(iii)  Walks: The following repairs
of existing walks are allowed without
permit or inspection:

1) Replacement of the decking,
stringers and flotation logs.

2) Repair or replacement of up
to 50 percent of the concrete portions
of a concrete float.

(iv)  The repairing of any portion
of amoorage in like manner to the original
construction is allowed providing the
resulting repair or replacement does not
cause an unsafe or overloaded condition.

(c) Regulations pertaining to alterations
and additions to moorages.

(i) Walkways and  supporting
structure.
EXCEPTION: Gangways and

standpipes required as a result of
any addition shall be provided in
conjunction with such addition.

(3) New Moorages

(a) Fire apparatus access roads. Access
to moorages shall be by fire apparatus access
roads capable of supporting the minimum
weight as determined by the fire code official.
Such roads shall be a minimum 20 feet wide,
and 26 feet wide at fire hydrant locations, with
not less than 13 feet-6 inches overhead
clearance. They shall be provided from the
nearest public way to the head of the gangway.
Fire apparatus turnarounds shall be required
on any fire access road having a dead end
exceeding 150 feet.

(b) Moorage exits. Two exit gangways
are required whenever any one of the
following conditions apply:



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

(i) The marginal walkway exceeds

250 feet.

(ii) Total distance from the nearest

point of apparatus set-up (usually at the
head of a gangway) to the most remote
portion of the moorage exceeds 800 feet.

EXCEPTION: Moorages used for the
moorage of pleasure boats without
covers (open moorage configuration)
and having not more than two floating
homes need have only one exit
gangway.

When two exit gangways are
required, they shall be separated by
the maximum distance possible so as
to avoid the possibility of any one fire
cutting off exit or access to both exit
gangways.

(c) Fire protection.

(i) Moorages having any portion of a

floating structure more than 250 feet from
the point of fire apparatus set up, shall
have a dry standpipe system designed and
installed in accordance with the Fire
Code, NFPA 14 and the following:

1) Have a water supply that
complies with any one of the
following:

a. Municipal water
providing 1000 GPM through an
approved fire hydrant located
within 50 feet of the closest point
of fire department access to a
moorage site exit ramp with a Fire
Department Connection (FDC)
within 50 feet of this fire hydrant.

b. Rivers or associated
bodies of water with pump or
pumps capable of providing 250
GPM at 100 psi to any single
outlet on the standpipe system.
Pumps are to be powered with
natural gas or propane and be

(10) 44

listed by Underwriters

Laboratory.

2) Have standpipe sized to
provide 250 gallons per minute at 100
psi pressure to any single outlet with
a maximum input pressure of 150 psi.

3) Have adequate drain valves
installed to ensure complete drainage.

4) Have gate valve outlets
made of noncorroding metal, 2-1/2
inch 1.D. with National Standard
threads spaced a distance apart as
follows:

a. For moorages having
marine service stations, floating
homes or other type of structures,
having permanent living quarters,
valves are to be every 100 feet and
within 50 feet of the end of
walkways.

b. For moorages serving
only boathouses, valves are to be
every 150 feet and within 75 feet
of the end of the walkways.

c. For moorages having
only open moorage of pleasure
boats, standpipes shall only be
required along the marginal
walkway with valves required
only at intersecting main
walkways, or not less than every
200 feet and 100 feet from the end
of marginal walkways not having
intersecting walkways.

5) All fire protection standpipe
systems shall be installed under
benefit of permit from the Gresham
Building Department.

6) Standpipe systems shall be
tested in accordance with the Fire
Code and NFPA 14. The Gresham
Fire Department shall be notified at
least 24 hours in advance of all tests



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

and tests shall be done in their
presence or the presence of their
representative. An annual service test
will be conducted by a qualified
service agency to assure the
continuity of the system.

EXCEPTION: Installations for
moorages used exclusively for
loading and off loading boats or
vessels and transient tie-up
moorages.

(if) Fire extinguishers rated not
less then 3A:40BC shall be placed in
cabinets on posts beginning at the start of
the walkway system and repeated at
intervals not to exceed 150 feet on all
walkways and finger floats.

(4) Gangways, and
Walks.

Ramps, Walkways

(@) Hlumination. Gangways, ramps and
walkways shall be illuminated by lights
designed, constructed and maintained to
provide a minimum average of 1-foot candle
of light per square foot at the walking surface.

EXCEPTION: Recreational  boat
launching and transient tie up facilities.

(b) Slope and Surface. Gangways and
ramps shall have a maximum slope of 1
vertical to 2.5 horizontal and shall have a non-
slip walking surface or surface cleats securely
fastened in place with a maximum spacing
center to center of 1 foot 6 inches.

(c) Gangway width and rails. Gangways
shall have a minimum, unobstructed width of
five feet when a single gangway is required
and four feet when more than one gangway is
required and shall be provided with guardrails
and handrails as required by the building code.
Intermediate landings shall not be required for
gangways.

EXCEPTION: Gangways serving an
occupant load less than 10 and gangways
serving recreational boat launching and

(10) 45

transient tie up facilities need not be more
than 4 feet in width.

(d) Walkway width. Walkways shall
have a minimum, unobstructed width of six
feet, except for finger-walkways, which may
be three feet in width. Cleats, bull rails,
mooring connectors, utility stands and the like
may project into the required width of main

and marginal walkways.
(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1636,
Enacted, 01/18/2007)

10.60.080 Engineered Construction.

(1) General. Except those structures
conforming to the conventional construction
methods and materials, the minimum structural
design of floating structures and moorages shall be
in conformity with all applicable sections of the
State Building Code and the requirements of this
section.

(2) Engineer of Record.

(a) Hereafter, where the term “engineer
of record" is written it shall mean either
engineer or architect of record.

(b) The piling, mooring connectors, the
gangway, and flotation system for all floating
structures shall have an engineer or architect
of record who is registered in Oregon.

(c) The Engineer of Record shall be
responsible for establishing the design criteria
and completing the design of the complete
project. The Engineer of Record shall do this
by preparing and certifying complete
construction drawings and calculations for
structural strength and flotation. The design
criteria shall be substantiated by the Engineer
of Record and noted on the first sheet of the
construction drawings.

(d) If engineers or architects other than
the Engineer of Record have been engaged to
design a portion of the project (piles for
example), the Engineer of Record is to:



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

(i) Verify that the other engineer(s)
or architect(s) have provided drawings
and calculations certified by an Oregon
engineer or architect.

(ii) Verify that the other engineer(s)
or architect(s) have used design criteria
(loads, load combinations, etc.) that have
been established by the Engineer of
Record.

(iii) Verify the compatibility of the
portion's design with the design of the
complete project.

(iv) Verify that the designs of
structural  connections between the
portion(s) of the project designed by other
engineers and portions designed by the
Engineer of Record have been
accomplished by an engineer or architect
registered in Oregon.

(v) Place review approval stamp on
all drawings and calculations prepared by
the other engineers showing that a.
through d. have been accomplished.

(3) Loading.

(@) All floating structures, piling,
mooring devices and gangways shall be
designed and constructed to sustain, within the
stress limitations specified in the State
Building Code, all applicable loads specified
in the State Building Code and this ordinance.

(b) Current loads shall be calculated on
the basis of maximum current anticipated at
the location of the structure.

(c) Wave and wake loads shall be
calculated on the basis of the maximum
possible wave and/or wake that can be
expected at the location of the structure.

(d) Impact loads from boats, debris and
other objects shall be considered with a
minimum velocity of 2 feet per second.

(10) 46

(e) Gangways not more than 6 feet wide
shall be designed to sustain a live load of 50
psf unless they serve structures that contain an
occupancy where more than 50 people may
occupy a room at one time such as some
dining establishments or meeting rooms.
Those gangways and all those more than 6 feet
wide shall be designed to sustain a live load of
100 psf.

EXCEPTION: Gangways not more than
6 feet wide serving public recreational
boat launching and transient tie up
facilities may be designed to sustain a live
load of 40 psf.

(f) All  floating structures, piling,
mooring connectors, gangways and ramps
shall be designed and constructed to resist
lateral forces produced by the reasonable
combination of expected wind, current,
wave/wake and impact loads at the location.

(4) Mooring connectors.

(a) Every floating structure shall be
moored with connectors having the capacity
to hold the structure in place under all
expected conditions.

(b) All structures the mooring connectors
are attached to, including walkways, pilings,
or others, shall be designed to withstand the
loads from the mooring connectors. The
engineer of record's design criteria for the
project shall include the maximum
dimensions of the floating structure(s) as these

determine the loads on the mooring
connectors and their supports.
(5) Piling.

(@) The floating structure shall be

attached to piling which is adequate to resist
lateral forces produced by any normally
expected combination of wind, current, wave,
wake and impact.

(b) The minimum height of the top of the
piling shall be a minimum of two feet above
the 100 year flood elevation as shown on the



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

Federal Insurance Rate Maps published by the
Federal Emergency Management Agency.

(6) Flotation. The following applies to all

floating structures:

(@) Floating  structures  shall  be
constructed and maintained to provide a
flotation system that complies with the
requirements of this article. The flotation
devices shall be structurally sound and
securely attached to the framing for the
superstructure, except that foam flotation
blocks may be held in place by friction only.
The flotation systems shall provide support
adequate to provide a level and safe walking
surface under all reasonable load conditions.

EXCEPTION: Floating  homes,
boathouses and combos need only have
adequate flotation to maintain a minimum
of 4 % inch clearance above water under
all applicable conditions.

(b) Clearance Above Water. The
clearance above water as measured from the
water line to the top of the lowest point on the
floor or deck under usual dead load
conditions, shall not be less than | foot-0
inches for walkways, and not less than 1 foot-
8 inches for all other floating structures.

(c) Live Loads. Inaddition to dead loads,
the flotation system shall be adequate to
support the maximum condition of the
following minimum live loads. Depending on
use, higher loads may be more appropriate.

(i) 40 psf applied to the gross floor
area.

(if) A concentrated load of 300 Ibs. at
stairs.

(iii) For nonresidential
occupancies, the live load required by the
State Building Code for the particular
nonresidential occupancy.

(iv) Pedestrian walkways or ramps 40
psf.

(10) 47

(V) At locations where live loads
are transmitted from gangways to floating
structures, the live load may be reduced
40 percent on the gangway for purposes of
calculating the reaction only. Additional
flotation may have to be provided to
compensate for this reaction on the
floating system to maintain the prescribed
clearance above water.

(d) Stability with short term, off-center
loading or wind loading. The floating
structure when subjected to either off-center
loading or wind loading shall not exceed the
following limitations:

(i) The maximum angle of list shall
not exceed 4.0 degrees, or the clearance
above water when measured from the
water line to the top of the first floor or
deck shall not be less than 1/3 of the
normal clearance above water, whichever
is the more restrictive.

(ii) The ratio of resisting moment
(Mr) to applied moment (Ma) shall be
equal or greater than unity: The resisting
moment due to buoyancy (Mr) shall be
computed about a longitudinal axis
passing through the center of gravity at a
list angle of not more than 4.0 degrees.

(iii) The minimum off-center loading
shall be considered as applicable to the
completed structure and shall be
considered in addition to all dead loads. It
shall consist of a minimum live load of 100
pounds per lineal foot of floor length at
the first floor and 50 pounds per lineal
foot of floor length at each additional
floor or loft. If the width of the floor or
loft exceeds 20 feet then the load shall
consist of 5 pounds times the width of the
floor per lineal foot of floor length at the
first floor and 2.5 pounds times the width
of the floor per lineal foot of floor length
at each additional floor or loft. These
uniform live loads are to be applied
halfway between the center of gravity and
the outside edges of the floors. The
overturning moments resulting from the



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

off-center loadings (Ma) shall be
computed about both sides of the center
axis of gravity.

(iv) Other appropriate eccentric or
off-center loading due to wind, snow, ice,
live loads or combinations of these shall

also be considered.
(Ord. No. 1636; Enacted, 01/18/2007)

10.60.090 Electrical Installations.

(1) All electrical work shall be designed and
installed in accordance with the State of Oregon
Electrical Specialty Code, NFPA 303, The Oregon
Residential Specialty Code and this article.
Permits and inspections are required for all work.

(2) Transformer pads shall not be located
closer than eight feet to combustible surfaces and
two feet to noncombustible surfaces.

(3) Existing overhead power drops shall be
maintained a minimum of 12 feet above walking
surfaces and/or the ordinary high water line.

(4) New docks and replacement drops shall
be installed under the dock.

(5) Electrical installations within two feet of
the water shall be considered to be in a wet
environment, except that installations inside a
structure and not exposed to the water may be

considered to be in a dry environment.
(Ord. No. 1636, Enacted, 01/18/2007)

10.60.100 Plumbing Installations.

(1) Plumbing installations shall be designed
and installed in accordance with the Oregon
Plumbing Specialty Code, The Oregon Residential
Specialty Code and this article. Permits and
inspections shall be required for all work.

(2) Sewage ejectors shall be installed in
accordance with the manufacturer's instructions
and the Oregon Plumbing Specialty Code, except
that the head pressure required for testing drainage
systems is reduced from 10 feet to 5 feet for
ejectors installed at individual floating homes.

(10) 48

(3) Flexible connectors for water lines shall
be approved by the National Sanitation
Foundation and be of the type approved for mobile
home installations or marine use.

(4) Piping materials shall be as specified in
the Oregon Plumbing Specialty Code.

(5) Continuously running water through the
moorage supply line is an acceptable alternate to
pipe insulation to avoid pipe freezing.

(Ord. No. 1756, Amended, 08/20/2015; Ord. No. 1636,
Enacted, 01/18/2007)

10.60.110 Mechanical Installations.

All mechanical work including but not limited to
heating, air conditioning, ventilating, gas piping
and woodstoves, shall be designed and installed in
accordance with the State of Oregon Mechanical
Specialty Code, The Oregon Residential Specialty
Code and this article. Permits and inspections

shall be required for all work.
(Ord. No. 1636, Enacted, 01/18/2007)



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

Article 10.70
MOVING OF BUILDINGS
Sections:

10.70.010
10.70.020

Movement of Buildings.

Moving of Buildings, Permits
Required.

Liability.

Movement on State Highways.

Enforcement.

10.70.030
10.70.040
10.70.050

10.70.010 Moving of Buildings.

It shall be unlawful for any person to move any
building over or upon any street within the city
without having first obtained the necessary permits

from the city to do so.
(Ord. No. 1768, Enacted, 10/20/2016)

10.70.020 Moving of Buildings, Permits

Required.

(1) Placement or removal of buildings from
sites within the city requires a building permit. In
addition to all requirements set forth in the
building regulations, a building to be moved and
placed within the city shall be located and used in
a manner consistent with all zoning and land use
ordinances of the city, together with any other
applicable ordinances, laws or governmental
regulations.

(2) Buildings being moved on city rights-of-
way must first obtain an oversized or overweight

vehicle permit from the city.
(Ord. No. 1768, Enacted, 10/20/2016)

10.70.030 Liability.

(1) The permittee shall agree to hold
harmless, defend and indemnify the City of
Gresham, its officers, agents, and employees, for
all claims, demands, actions and suits, including
all attorney fees and costs for damage to property
or injury to a person arising out of moving of a
building. The permit shall not constitute an
authorization for damaging property nor constitute

(10) 49

a defense against whatever liability the permittee
incurs for personal injury or property damage
caused by the moving.

(2) The permittee shall secure, maintain, and
furnish certificates of insurance coverage of a type

and amount as required by the city attorney.
(Ord. No. 1768, Enacted, 10/20/2016)

10.70.040 Movement on State Highways.

If the building being moved travels through the city
exclusively on Interstate 84, no city oversized or

overweight vehicle permit is required.
(Ord. No. 1768, Enacted, 10/20/2016)

10.70.050 Enforcement.

Violation of any provision of this article, including
failure to obtain the necessary permits, may be
enforced in accordance with the provisions set forth
in GRC Atrticle 10.99, and may be subject to a fine

or penalty in the maximum amount of $10,000.00.
(Ord. No. 1768, Enacted, 10/20/2016)



GRESHAM REVISED CODE

Article 10.99
ENFORCEMENT
Sections:

10.99.010 Violation.

10.99.020 Authority to Inspect.

10.99.030 Fines, Penalties and Other
Enforcement Tools.

10.99.010 Violation.

A violation shall have occurred when any
requirement or provision of this chapter has not
been complied with. Violation of any provision of
this chapter may be subject to enforcement action

by the manager.
(Ord. No. 1700, Enacted, 03/03/2011)

10.99.020 Authority to Inspect.

The manager may enter any property, building or
premises in accordance with GRC 7.50.500
through GRC 7.50.520, to perform an inspection
in order to ensure compliance with any provision

of this chapter.
(Ord. No. 1700, Enacted, 03/03/2011)

10.99.030 Fines, Penalties, and Other
Enforcement Tools.

(1) Any condition caused or permitted to exist
in violation of any provision of this chapter is a
threat to public health and safety. Any such
condition is unlawful and constitutes a nuisance.

(2) Inaddition to any other remedies provided
herein, violation of any section of this chapter may
be enforced as set forth in GRC Article 7.50, or as
otherwise authorized by law.

(3) Unless otherwise specified, violation of
any section of this chapter may be subject to a fine
or penalty in the maximum amount of $1,000.
Each day on which a violation occurs or continues

is a separate violation.
(Ord. No. 1700, Enacted, 03/03/2011)

(10) 50



